Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2023

CHOG NIV
KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWomeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW®IQ1H2IW] (aIM]EDOA SO0

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

@1 UMD a0, 2023 awlauoenid 09
abalie 12 ) 09th December 2023
Vol J;” 1199 auyoallo 23 m“,\’fc? 4006
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, 23rd Vrischikam 1199
Saturday 1945 @R(NAOI®Mo 18
18th Agrahayana 1945
GH 03 MVAINIDB
oo (Moo dldmoem-ail) lda]
aile26m0a 1Mo
mMIA 64/6e103.a11/2023/ml@mo. @I4aImama oo, 2023 alrvoenid 8
1199 oyoilsro 22

1945 @orano@mo 17.

2023 alllmuoeni@d 7-00 GI@@ 6508 NAIBEMNA Qll80MIN6)e|SIOMI@ @IS$e O
&3SIMMMY B lomERMEBRE81Ss @RAlIlERIESID DBIMI@ (@ IMIRLEN|SICmIIM].

1AIBEMNN®S 2OMOQIMB (@100,

. 2l. VM@ BN,
Ml 6TVEe50l.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




2023-9£1 3-20 MMNIA 6393WImMmadaY

2023-ae1 6508 n)Mlavlq Joeilgl (¢zaun®l) eadauslmmdmy

@0® OloJeRlesllong  ag)9lal@BIMOLIN0  MVOAICTVOODIT  EHOS  NAIBHRA

Qilgoenioee ]SO @).

1994-0e1 6608 MMIMila joeildl @re:q aflensio
6RAVMI SalgpmM @I es
630)
&30 Wlanadany
aflole,.—1994-0e1 6208 olMlooeilgl  @e:Q  O@IMBUDaHo  &OeMIAM
@QIUDIEERUBESID aflensle BRRLMI ©.21QRM T WIEMAIDIBIHBNB@ILN0;

BHO8  QLOARNIM  MIWAMVE  AVEMASMODILILPODDIMIE  GIMW VDO
MSalSIOWSIEHOMET  GRYAUUDIAIBIM  AVIaN2IOEERUWD  Mlelaileyeemsay  ¢608
NQUIBERABLS BeNIELIRODIBlBNMIMOEI}0;

060U, @P@IMIM, FRIOMOMIOG GOeMELISN@OS 213-00 BOMGgI30 (1)-00
QUMW (@100 M@B:6a]3 @RUIE:0068303 QIlMIeIUla] 6HO8 NAIBERHRE @INPe O
&03lmmmMY ailgoenioeq |Siomymmyi—

1. 20060  (@I000BARe.—(1) ®»  aodallmmavdla)  2023-ee1  6HOS

mladle joeilgl (6eEL@I) SBAIMMMY  g)m) Gald alO@Do.

(2) D@ 9SMB (@I0NILIODIGD QUM I,

2. 1994-0r1 20-00 @OBQ ®IWL0ElRHNIV] BEENTI 621960 |ESENZGO6N.—ED™D
godaSlmmmy dleiaileildleoym  soeiom 1994-0e1 6208 oMbl joeilgl  @ryeglal
(1994-0e1 20) (D@IMBUDHO @IWIM @YY ag)MNIEM olEINAUTIBOe|S)E) 3 MO®TB
26 Q900 QAP PSEIB  AEemnIesldldlesnmm eSS  allswwnowl
(@1o6nIelMIeN30BleeaM @®a6em).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




3. 5800 Q@ flMss GREROLML—EIWIM GG:Qleel 5800 aldafleoad (1)-0o
90l fldd  “CEHUDIBlalOSIS:UWD,” o) AOSSIMYe  allamO@INe  BUDHo
“00ellMnINoMId06Mo,” ag)aM QAIDE0 allaNQllo GalBELSENMBOI6NM).

4. XVIag) of)aD GRELPYDo B2lBBODB.—(@IWOM @)B:qlee! 325-00 Qldlo{la) BUdaHOI}0

“@20ellinfo OO0V O2IQY@” ag)M UBlBHBHOTMIMMIGSEERMID] “@PELIO@o XVI ag)”
@) GalBCHENBMIG).

5. 32520) o) o RO QIdhla] B2lBLOB.—(EIWIM BYBFIEB, “@PELO@o XVI of)

20ellMEeBUd 6)@:E3:0050 §2IQMB”, ag)M UOlBHBHODIM) GUdaHo @INS alO@IAM Qldsla]
B2lBBHENZMIG), BRIV D) —

“325ag).  AlBQJalMo—0®  @GRELPOMIOM@I0 5800 QB fload@yo

@QUIUIODIGEIEHIDI]  “@0eilMITMI@:06Mo”  ag)MI@  euoMOLlMo  9UdO|OSSS
moellmyeangles  GIAICIEn®, GUDAIOEMo, WMINDo, dVoBDEMo,  MVoMVEO6Mo
@OOLIB @ BHOQYIFIDV@B o) GOAGLAMIGIMN I6N) .

allvoEle,06mo.—s0m @ORLOVOTITD 9aleIUIsjlgi88™m)0 ale A
mlBqjailaflslgoommye agymo@d 1986-ee1 aldlmubl@l (Mode:uem) @oa:glene (1986-ael

29-00 (B YY) EPDIM BT PeNLS| VI8 alseanslene Mldq)ailajlsissmmow
QUOBNHUBBN0  (@EIGWINEBRUBBN0  EEIMO® @G:Glele  alse@rRSleRe  GPAURGS)
@LOJ(@ Mo MBS DVISBS @PE® @PAMNEBRUY 9eNODIBleaM@I6M.”.

6. 326-00 Qo I8 BERNM].—(EIWIM @YB:QIeEl 326-00 Qld:)q {I@d,—

() (1ag) 210} ald0o IO ODIM Dallldle] BG2IGBBENEMIE),
BRIV —

“(1ag)) DD GPELPVOBVIER DD EYGFIM BlSlenss algerslelo, 1986-66!
aldlnudla’l  (oodem) @@Gimie (1986-081 29-00 BB @YGQ) GOOIM  5lld
26M308610IgI88 algeEnSlEle ANINO aIDTISIBB@RO® ALIMITMMIG06M RO
NITWe|s MMIMIle oelldlaes og)gldo &Sa®8le 2OMONNEIMIERSe  2AGEIGS)o
Soedadlelldd  Mledlaimaodldlemnmde,  ®vemaVlad @I  @Sne:S8o
20mOUIGIMI6B8BBl0 2AMEIBS}0 OHAVE@SO] MEaIm MIAQadlesssnzmymosm.”;

(i) @EIBIV0 ald®o 62108683 (1ag)) DalldloflM) GUDaHo @IOPE]ODIAM
DalQldhlo] GalBGHRENIEMIE), CRMIWD).—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




“(lag)ag)) (1ag)) SelQidla] @I®o0Mss mMladlaoelgloges &sadsio
2OMOQIIEI 683810 2I)O@LIGB)o ) [GITEYO) (X510 ) OAVE@SOlOS
20mOUIGIMAOD]IBIENM @Yo, HTVE SOl EDDD  GOMEIMBS DOMOQR  MIEGEUM
202NNV 06Mo,  HaldMEBMICDIN, Udlall®o, ag)eAlNAle)  agyamlaies
APA@EI88  963PONMNABN)0  HlaINMeeIdLele @regElad  mmlmileoeilglaliee
DnEQOME’IR0 DEROUNMNBBCHD 2laINH6923EeL6)0, MDD BIHSEI
(@IBRUDEEREIOSEWO  6ROLleS  aVIRIAOMIHAZEWO  @PSIMNAOMODIT  o@@aflaf
M@ SHIAM Do, ROV HSAGUY, OOMOUIGIM|EBRUB, 2IADELISUD @RAIG BRI
M3 a0lenamanIaTy 90q30I0}EOMENZGIMI6).”;

(i) (3)-90 DalAlBlT) ald00 @IOLLODIAN DalQldle] B2IGBHEENEMIE),
GOV

“3) ol oeilgles), emMadlezd, eI o@emsslee @YUD  AIFlewO
a@2=Bal  afle@o  S03  @ESIMOOMOMIGED, G@RLPOMEWI MM  GBRYBGIGEID
@POIMS1S1en88 2156838l6e10, GeLIEIE3 1986-0e1 aldlmudlm] (Mode:uem) @yB:QImo
(1986-0£1 29-00 BB BYBY) GO Bl¥lenss aiseErglerd 988 moeilmyTomMie:06m
@IQAUBOMMEBRUD  MOIAIMICWI  RIWVIGHRICI  SalQRMDIM  (H0AlB06mMeBRUd
a0 ]SIOTMOQMMN @IE).”.

7. 326-00 Qo flaY GUdaHo o NBIW Qldhla ]3BUB GalBHOTB.—(IWIM BVB:Glerl 326-00

QIS l0) GUDaHO OO JODIAM Qe [JHUB B2IBBBEENBMIG, BRMIVDY:—

“3262g). MWVBH60A8 WIBE3UEBRUd BVeMMIlEd MSqleldeasensmoseman.—(1)
00 ERHJIMN Bldlern cregmlad 1986-0e aldlrudldl (Loo@:Hem) @YBQIGEI

(1986-081  29-00 GHMB @OBY) OISR  9eMRILSIVII88  algsERSlEEID
au0m0ellmy MoMI@:0emMaRMOD] NINWEL]S MVABHHIB alj0eesiaileeym MIdE3U0aRUD
MSq|le1ese6em® @:vemmileilend somoaodlmmoaiclesimmmos.

(2) (1)-00 9al0Idl{ldd «1000dUDlaflgiIss Mlde3UDER8MID]  NIMWeR]S
@ISl  @R®eMR  HVeMMUlElHNg OMISSIOm  EWINOMIT  AUDEOIAMIDQUN
©21WACIFAVEM D00 [ICHNEMMo  BVEIHIOMBY  GORVEMBVI@  BDemdmild
O@I0IROMOASIBHENZOAIEN).

(3) (190 9alQldla] @EISHOOMB8 o@oO@®BlER0  MIBE3U0BRUD  LIGl)
@OOMOo  MIBE3UIEBRUWBBOHMIMVIORID] 8oy  @TVOBIMSsI®,  B®edavld
@O@OMONSIHENMDBI@ 2 l0ILDESIAM  AVMAEREIES, @POMOe  MIGEZUVEBRUY

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




MSqjleneeomMm@IMss  @MA@]  &»VemMmilad  @oUld:Ola @I MEBEI@IECWO
B 0)ME|BSEIBMIGI.

(4) (300 2aldl] (@IGOOMB8 @U@0 M@V
B0}ODSY M ®UB6)|HS@BR BROO0 MIOIAOMEBBUD MSq fleIsenmM@IM eavE@:S0l
9SMSl MSalSIBUD  ©OBHOBNICBB/EMMo  BPOMOo  MIOIAIMo  MSa{leIeeM @3l@d
OMVE3016H690 DEgem®EIIe0 dOMOQEIMIcN]S 2EBPWAVNEMI al0RB@EN0 Ofl¥aico
96M30XIgieeNEEI@ @@ BMINIEEIaINID]  BEMBIBS]  OTVE@SClOBOTIOOEWI
@UOLIBIT  @OOMOo  9ERPWILOOMDIOHOE®I  MVABNIAIT)  @PaSHS  MSalsl
ajleolesoaimmmosny.

(5) (1)-00 9alQId:la] (@18:00M88 MBHSIBIOE MIGEZUDEBRUD aldrileeymm @lad
Soemil@  afl¥al  AO)OMIMaldHo, BvedaVlellommleon  aull@dlescam  ag
MSalSI&HUdHmNIMY0  BoWo  QAIEIOMAUWOMIM, qVBHCIN) GPOmOo  Qll¥alB6)
SvendaVleilleng 6a@d aile ~iacmoamM®oem:

ag)MO@, @V@IH000 alle anmomM®I) )M &vedavlella) aloIoMss©)
alO@}AIIM MODAID @GRAITVO0 MTIBHENZDIEN).

3266nil. @0elMIMMIB0eMOMIE HIVES0IWOS dOMOQEMIEBRU.—(1) DD
@OERLPDOBIOL! QAUUMOGUD EloeLleaMM oBO®O0} BVSIOMTIOOWI0 HIVEESOIB6)
N@AMSaISIS:Ud @DOoElLHIM @0, af)IMIT DD @YY (@ 18:006MI BRMIM BHlslenss
21368803 (130060 EIWIBHINUM BQBIMIEERUD ILLIWILHIIM GIMIE).

(2) @oellm§MoMIE:06MARMID] NIMLERS D EPRELP@OMIND B:l¥lensREMO
@OLIBIT O@IVAo (@ IVNIEIOMIENS] NEQOMSSIE0 MDA (@ ISI0MSSEGO GO
2NAOEIGUD BHOOIGHANIDI] MIBQaOllecnM@IMSS ag)elo @oUWlE:006838}0 HIVESOlB6)
26M30lalae)amnmoen.

(3) ®AV(E501B4), BOMOUUDLLISEBRSIMB, 621WABEISTVEM @RAI@4| BUdaHo,
@oeilmnimoi@:06emanaol NITWER|S MY  GRELPOMIGED  @@IVAWo
@il Omlenss negemssleo MAEIB0600 @MIM MleHl IO 230els:ud
mldqjedlecmnm@lay  eniaweq]s MMIUlo@d enemEla@d  mlary 0enE  eloHo  ©all@d
HU@IOD @D §alLlaf 6.21QYIQRM@I6M).

3260l. Id@IAle) moeilmie aamlmile joeillgleeed @Roulle® ogemdailewnso

86M0)ANTIM88  SOMOQEIMI0.—(1)  OAVEE O], Satomemosimilenes mIdeEUDla)
@000, 6UAGIGly  moellmiednud  ee@®mooyMIemMd  MIdGlay  quNeICYY

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




mledHailosymalemo @avud oblay mymlmilejoerilglessnd @roUlei® o@eadmilesed
M@ BM@IMYo ag)efo QflSidudele a@emeslelo alBlMVOBRSIHSWI0, BaNISM, DBIRINAT,
QIIAVO®o, @RYUDI@, @B NEQEME;IL0 MNJalMo of)MIAWIOS OSAMUNBB)0
06 HHQUUDENHIBHN o DOMOAUIGIM| MENDIOlHHM ®I6N).

(2) (1)-00 9alQId)a{lor! QIRINNBUB LlolEeIM «@O®IO} BBSIHAFWEATD
OMVE@ 30188 BYDI00 O} IDVIT BIOWIDo al@IMIDI00 ©IVIT B0llICHEROW
adl® ala@moRmM@os).

326l  @aud  odlavimodl  eniaweq]s  ol0IN0&00.—(1) 630600

mladle oeilglage  moeilmge  cRIADIGlEH@,  BUOAIOEMo, DIV,  AVoBEOEMo,
MoMI®06Mo  BPDIONG  BHOQIFIV@  og)MIQII@ODI]  NIMWER]S  BIVLAIMEEBUD
MN@BMOIOMF 0 )BNERO BIUIBEN AP &aleldl QlaOleeM@IN) 60600 Mmoeilmy
DMaldBHMYP MMEHENE IMVQ o0lny MlvDIDICBeMEMle @YD  MIvDUD]HHIM
ADIDI@D CLRIOIBHENZMIMI6NT):

a@)MO@, @A oblmflay VB8 Mloes MlURIV]2fl5I88aldto, TVBLSID
Nvidlly]  dlosslemeedsd  Soeom Mlods)  &H®emalld  MlvRileedd
aloslpjom@moe).

(2) 80600 MOLIlMy 9@aIBE:MIe WITVA oLl MMlaile joeilglesed @roeg)ssl@d
aBO®BIEo @VoUTlB®  a@RBMAVIEHN0  ag)pJ0  MOAVOMIOLID}o  @OAUAVIM
Olomlee; mmed  cegll@  mmladlajoeilgl  @loy@omilesjesncanm  @ROM©o
S0rIwsallmssi|erId M@ EH6eN3ma6).

(3) o@oosslee moelmy 90eldBHM (2)-00 DalQldhla] ©@IE00 QIQIMRO
0210015188 @A obln @RsDeM@I@  all$alnoyEmI@Om, @), @ITCIndaVo
@PMIBY LOMAIMo allPEWISIHYS] HDVSICHHENB®IEN):

ag)MI@, Mluaile @ M@ 6@IeRI0 FlaITVEOMIMNIEUaHAIe @IAVA adlm)
@RS BN afl¥al AIOOMIOT NO@ED BVOMOO ail® TDDVSIHHNIIM o 10S)8S).

(4) @3 abdlge adle@io 538 enil QI l@d @I®latodlajldlesnmm  ailwo
8a10@MIBI@] B:)51(RlB@ID] BHEMBNVBEI DVSIHHOM @6,

B) @Vd bl ERsWenIm  alldalaioemian  eslemdleo
mfledlescamm  meRe®®Ilele  MSaISI@®UWEs  Gowo  AUOIO®, @MVA  oblmy
@SB ®AIHO BRAMOOHI@ Afl¢¥al a1l @GgElMy mmlmily joerilglallad mloniss
aBOMI0} BILAIMA M@BOM OTVES0OlAS) Allrven@lesndamos.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(6) MBHESOBIBMO @REEJEI@D, B3:0£108:0L168381@ MVBHLHIA al}N6)e|Siailacymm
223 MIBEGUOEBRUBBHMITVIMAODI], e joeilgleseo oBOMBel)o moeilmy
DDaloBHHOM @6ELIBIT MILIM DBalIBHOINS NEMEOTD, GPSELIE;TD BYESIFITME®O
B0} BISEHMEMO B ODSISEBBIOS 9SAHOS GOOLBITM  HOBAUUDLNINO

(%)

@JMVA ooy @S ENM D@D mlary al}B6NMICI BOUISHMOCI

&3910108900I M 6.,

8. 327-00 QIda{lMlaldh00 o RO Qldhlo] B2IBLO@.—(@IWIM @B:Qleel 327-00
QB I0) 0100 IO JODIAM Qldla] BalGBHHENZMIGN), BRMIDOY.—

“327.  euomoelmieBrud  MocAleM@IMIe  MledHalleayan@lmie  moeilmy
DMalIBHALNBS  2NAOEISHWB.—(1)  eemaIindelmEensle  @oeeAIMdLlmiERslo
@Oal®HSSHONI®  NIQa0ld:  moeilmiednrsle  MLorGlEM@IMOIT]  algeBrgleRld

©66NIGLIBSIGRID mlden@lajlsiss (@18006@0 @16)LJ;] @D OIVES0I
e B:BaHl 2 ]lBleeM®} GalIHLIMS[EMO GD® QILa |ODIe0 WOODIEMSS (@ ICMHE:
enilMmi>»E80  MVoRO6MIGE80 ML2EB:0leee6eMmE® 0600 @Oelmy 2@aldBHe03@]o
SO,

(2) @pareM88 MIMIGUd @PELIBITE MVoBOMIBGUd ag)fjo TLADOM}o
vol@I@ MleIXl@ qVyEHIEEOMmEm, HTVESO] BPM@ VAo B ld@EMISITVIMOT3
M1Be3uUBleanmM @Yo ag)sPo GPEERAHM@IBS TLOLIA TVE223]E:0lGEENEEIMI6N).

(3) madladlepeilgl  mleouilajlgiss  &laIMEeIBEHN0  B0I0}BIBEHD
@POMOo  MIEIMIEBRU  @)Bla |ODI@  6UOIAlENM@IMIe MBS0  O2IGM@IMMOTI]
80600 MOy O@aldBHMIe 21SEBREIGEID OBENIGRINGSIERID Mot d:Batl2lSI88 (18000
m0eilnieerud cIAMIClal MledHa leasenzmosm).

(4) (3)-090 21U} flOr AINNGUD LI10aLilEeM «BODIO} CDBOSWI0 CGAWMD,
OMVE@ 30188 @Yo O} IDVIT BIOWOIDD®0 al@IMIDI00 © V@ Ball@ocmH@RO@
adle aymomoaM o).’

9. 328-00 QI MBS BEENTI.—@EIWOM BYB:GIOEI 328-00 QB {l@d,—

() 208=INM@  WBHBODIAT aldh®o IO O  MOARIN@  UBlBaHro
GalBCHHENZMIGM), BOMIDDY:—

“@0ellnieanud  dlese ealgpam@I)  @oellmy  9@aldBSHMAICO
9SAMOMIAIEDI GIATVAHIOMIAIECWI 98B H0IA”;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(i) cmlelailenss aloiMuodleel “a@o®meslelo alGlVOERSIOS SAIVLOMINICI
@®OIDMVAHIOMIAIEWI”  a)M  QAUIBNGHUHE  aldh®o “MelM|  9@aldBSHMAICWO
@UOLIBIM o@OMBIEN0 o IGlNOERSIHS DSAMUOMIAIEI MIATVEHIOMAIEWI” ag)(M
QUIENDHSBlo “al0lc0d MelMieRd Mleo SalQIMDIT” o) QUOBNGHUBHE) ald0o
“00ellnyeanud M1esw0 BaI1gRMTIM” ag)aN AUIBNIGSBlo BalQBHSENBMIE).

10. 329-00 QIdlolN}e 100 o)W Qidhla] GaIBBH@.—(EIWIM @OB:Fleel 329-00
QB l0) ald 00 DI JODIAM Qldla] BalGBHHENZMIGN), BRMIDOY.—

“329. 20@@3q sl moeilng suoaIoeMo—(1) 69600 MMIMUla joeilglane mymladlejwd
@I6RUDOMB8 ag)p)o AflSieEl@® Mlmio ML BRI  Mlamie  aIdeMlesy

MNdalMednglad Mlmipe ag AREM®MO aldlavoarglad Mmlae enla0jMlel O@3lsearRud,
el  anemlmy LMo WeBUY, MIBIBUD, aldBefls TLMJWEBRUE MDEIWAILHS
S0JOMIM  @IGUUDM  SHADSODI@  MIEMI  HAVE SOl Oatdmemoglailmodd
Oladiadatilaflsiss  aegooerlege  quoeisglad  alemo  eud®Idly  @oellmyeasud
Q@@ S| 6UEIGIENMTIMSBS (B21lEB:06MEBRUY aPBe|0SIBLHENEEIGN).

(2) (D-00 2alidla] (@ISHO00 GUOAIDlLY @OoIAlajlgiss  moellmieerud
WAl MSINIVE66)0|SIO®  TMMIB:EeMOMIEMO  MIdmod@em@®Iemo  Galensl
B06MBIBAIIB}HERI af) DM BNGEWI 62lQIM aldSIgOm@®I6M.”.

11. 331-00 QI {lNBS EEBERVMI].—(EIWIM @YB:Gleel 331-00 Ql:)q {l@d,—

() (1)-90 9alidofld) ald0o IO DalQldle] BG2lGBHEENMEMIE),
BRIV —

“(1) auo, G, neilmmel EOLIBIGE oOloa@ SHYUES TVoMIG06M oo
Lo MW@ (@ICRULOTHIMG:EOMO  al}0BOMI  SSlermmBlsecnmm  @al
0630UMB8SOMO® MMIMleoelldl, GPO®Oo ¢JIMRMHESI TVDBOEBRESI (@ ITIOR®
@@ TN leemM@IMS8S alELGIEB:00 MABWEMM M@E; oBOQSIBHLEENZMIEM.”;

(i) @OEIBIV0 ald0o 62I0H06q]g (1)-00 Daldldlo{lNIBUDaHO @IHEE|ODIAM
DalQld)a [}3U0 Gal@BHEENIZMIE), BRMIWD).:—

“(lag) 0600 m@Imilejoeilgll  moeilmymomis.oemomlay  ealendl
Sl |@d @IGRULODOIMG:EO™O 2 l}OGOYMO @OMIEWILIMOIQ aV}>004@3a
BOEMBEOMENIEM0 BYAIUDIRNSIT 2013-0e1 G ©90F Q) HN®A GHHIMUMBEIVAHID DAY
SOMMIatooMal 0 e @odladlatmd, dlanoenileileQeuad @y dleaugladenad

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




@&  (2013-ee1  30-00  GHMB  @OBQY) (@060 Al  Qllsamn@de.od
(@18:006MI aldSOBIEMNO AVIBODIAUIEEBRE MEEUMEWI UMV} Y2l cLeENZ®I6).

(1eni) (lag) 9alQidla] @100 MMIMileoeillgl crd=eleoym @l
MALIdlOM MMHHE  @oMEdIVlgPem  acge®®ilele  GOAIUDIEERUIESIWI
9ale@IUIBHIND aldSIBSOEY.

(1and)  @oellmimemid06m  (@IQIBODMEERUIENIX]  a3Slemm)  Blseeam
Mo Raled  mengld Mot imao®  Ealed  eIRXISEMBITD @O
aflmleorileam@lay 80600 mmlavla joeilgl@ye madwemm M@BeHNE®Ie.

(1) @2eilninomid,0em @ IIR@MMEBRUBBIV] M3Bal Dale@oUlajflommie
a)MO@  Geoud  allalllw  ®:EeMERsI@  9aleIUileercmmMI®  EAlwil@d
22ellNMMISB06M  (@IAUBODMERU  alNOIVEIGNMDIN)  TLOWIROIW  ag)LJ0
Msalslagio mmladlejoeilgl avile:clesosmsmosn:

a)MI@,  AVBHSIAIOMR MM  GPMAD]  WLPOD® (@I Gl
06Q000IwsO®IMe  calenEl  MOGIAUIDIENE@EDI  DalEIWINBNGEWI  ©)21QIMD
aloSIgJomm®o6eM.”;

(i) (2)-00 9ol  “(1)-00 DalQlBlafiel®000 AR  QilE26mIalMo
©.21QREMUOUD” ag)M ENVBOGIMIe BPEOOMIM 2llaMOTIMIe QAUIBNBUBEN0 ald0o
“(1ag)) 20101Ba] @10000 FA] S:EENZOMBIUIUB” ag)(M ENIIBOQI0 BVBHNo BOBHOQI0
QOGS0 GalBBHNENZMIGM).

12. 332-00 Qldslofla) 6U0aHo o NI QIBhaldhUd GalGLH@.—EIWIM BRBGIeE!

332-00 QU I BUdaHo @INP O QIBe JBUD B2l@BHEENIIENT), BRI OY:—

“332a0). QLB 202l B:06m 6300 P e0) N0 iloe@d.—

Il joeilgles), &:memmilad @0@le:000 @IOMIMIBNGEWO @PeLIEITE TVBHSHIAQ
@@ IB000 @YUV |SIGHEDO  6)21QRMIOAUBIM, NEQeOMEBIEe MEGUD  V|@OoBEOEM
N2 IMAR@O]  G2IBAT), @P@MOo MEGUD  AVoROMIUNIAIMEEBUD  @oUIId:Ola)
@IS&HOOMSB8  MININLM®:Blo  QAUUMOBSBle  @PMIMVOla] MBBHIB  MOTIELIESI
al}06)e|Si0ilese6001mm 203N MIBEZUOEBRUBHE) allew@aol MO}
20eilMNIMoMIG06M alFL@IGUd Mundail@edaRaM 6.

332enil. ol joeilgl almloiool al0l8UDOWMD0 MldlaueMmAllo

236 ]S16OMNEMIneMAN.—mMIMile joeilgldlleer moellmimiemie:0em @IQIdGmMERRs)o0

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




10

alRLOIHBYo @QYQUUDIAOD MOMNBEMLEBRUY al0eilajje@06n3)o, mleiallenss
TaaRuBeemMIVORIDISIMNEN (@IIBODIENMO®Me  MSq flelssmmemmyo
900 SOOI BELIEID (HDDOD aloleUdIWM™}o mMldle:xemalo
MSOOMMM@IMOIAUUDINOD (@A BH06MBRUW  o@BBee|Sicomenz®  mmladlajoeildlanes
OOl @06,

332008l.  QBDle:810S  9OMOQIGIOIEBRSl0  BIQdiOEBRUd  Olee JodS

02IQIMNOIMBS o 10016MAHlZ:EERB0.—(1) DOV  @OELPVOTINL!  QAUITLOSBIOS
aBOO®B IR0 LloCLIMNEAD @RELIBITE SaldmMunelanslelo 22ev@engleo  aoeilmo

aellesgjolays, @816 Geglsslad  dledHellead  agymlal  90deq|esw)sSs
20ellMIMoMIG0eMAR@OI]  NITWOR]S  aBO@EIER0  BIQIOIBR,  MVoeNIAUSla)
QllI063BUD oBO@IVOUBBN 0 HTVE@SO] MMBaldeB: GlEa]0d3 6.21QIINMIE.

2) oladle oeilgles  qUBESIB  B:0e10:3:0eIBRSIM  al}06)e]Siailesymm
2AQPMIdE3UERWSs  allew@modl, (1)-00  Qaldidle] (@100  LloALIMERRSIo
BQBIMIEBRSI0 OlBe |0BS ©.21QRMN BYBBUBBE) o ldOIEMIaHlB0 M@ @I6N).

(3) @OQIVIUBHE)  EBIANEMO  MaHSEMD  DENIILAAN OOV
(3)0}BZUDIBOTMINSEWI MM RBQYDOEWI (1)-00 Dalld] (@100 HMQPIW &1} Oleajods
M@ 2BH@O0IB0, B3QMLUNIaINOMINBEA@D, alBIMODID0 Oat! AUSD @YY@ alle
M@ UBlerHlB6)6)0 |ESEMEMOET.

33200, @oRIMITVOMISHOEM  EHHMBEBRUBHS QLA IMBS  DIAAVENIBHE)

(@IG@IVMBOMNO®  AlINNBUd.—(1)  mmImilejoeildles), qUBEHId  DeM0LeM

2IS68RUBEH60  al}0ea]siellesmnmm  m0dQMIldE3UERUIEHESD  allewMID, 6H(Ela®
22ellNMMIS06M  6H(B6ERUY @PeLIEIT MldIMIBe3M MUOLIEBUD af)MIIeS
OOISSIOM @ORMVIBNMAIBHE MBI B¥1QI0LNEEID DBANBEBI BHHUA alELDIBES0
900 |OSWBBMY0 DM@ M@0  ldlAMNYSIOMIOD@BS O  BIOONINMEBRS)0
M@ IR @I6).

(2) mymladlajoeilgles), 6o Bley® moelmimomia06m Ge:(13633UD @o6E]8sl@d
MIdamode2em MUOLIERUB af)MIAU@IOS H@IFS}OD @IAMILMAUDIDS BHHADDIMo
aflemosomlmyo 6aleNE]l a10886UB, &SlMNRIEBRUB, GlOBTVGlU) TVVB0OIEBRUB, UJq]
GaHIa )38, aflniloe@  eaEIMby) qVVG0EERUWE  SERI  DalEWIN(EIGAI
(@IB@ILRMBOQMID MolWOMEBRUB oGBS} @IG.”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




11

13. 333-00 QI)a I8 6EENGI.—(EIWIM @G:FIee! 333-00 Qld:a{lad dleinileyss
a0 @@ (1)-00 9alQldla o] GPEOAIGSEMMo @@ IBI00 @Reealg (1)-0o
9al0lB)o{lNIEUDaHO WIS |ODIAM Dalldsla] Bal@BHOENZGIG), BRI OY.—

“(2) @IO®IVIBe  HOM® M @laoml  dlaime  ayeausslele
miladle oeilgleo@ @oldlesdtn®, eeeirummileoom a@ed@aslee MneIo MoleIwle:o
BOB}®HB0S B0} alGlaldSIEWI BOMMIE2I0GEID MVoLISle |60 aldSIglOm™Y0, BPOM®o
@YCSO @OO00  al0laldSIWIOS MVoLINSHEMI  90allsOmI@d @ean  @oellmio
BIA®IBleeMOAIMM 20qj088MEMe MMIMSlajoellgl mlvnidleanm odlnd m@del
mladle joeilgl 21)NMEINSIOMIDIS 88 moeiflmyo CUDAIOIBHMQAIBEH
BBV BHUBCHI @D BE)BHAICOENZDAIEN):

a@)MO@,  @POMOo  ablAVGUW  @ElMTMIBOMOTIMSE LOOBGLO
©.21e1lBMHENIUD 3060  MIOBHIZHOMW  ol0SIpPOmM  B@R®  MMIMJle joeilg]
MIBERUDIENY0 (1B MINBBI00D] BRSEHOENIBGRAI6N).”.

14. 3340V QoY ald:00 al)DID Qldla] G2I8HO@.—(EIWOM @G:gleel 334Ul

QIS {lNald:00 MDY alO@IAN Adsle] GalBGHHEMZMIETY, BVGIWD):—

“334ml. @oellmiTomig:06m anenEleag e fle:oemoe.—(1) 60600 mmlmile joeilgl@yo

“@0ellMnINoMIB06M a06NE” ag)aM Galdl@ B30} anes 0o ild:0leLeeMmR®o, @O TVBHSHIB
DEMIBOIIM 213EBRUIGHND lj06)aS3ileeymm M0dYMIBE3UDEERUBEHNI EPMIAVIGRIV
OBB000 6).2ICQYENMBMIANIEM).

(2) @0ellm§moMIE:06mM aNMEIGRIRE @I ]OWIMAI QIAT QIIEHHNB®IGN),
@O O):—

(ag)  @0elMIMVoMIBO6M  £lorLIMEERMOD]  NIMWER]S  allsoswo
©aMITQIWICWI WHVSIHBS® @}BBUD;

(enil)  @elM§MMI06M  (EIAIBOMMEBBUBLHID] 6508 |E0Q  BIVIAHIDD
60MBaloemmilenileilgl (ril.agym.eea@.) anendl@d mlanie eIEla) MVeERIQIME:UD;

() oo eCMIeRIEn0D]  eIcly  MIGaI0eMaVAHla]  @)B:3E80
DEREOMEB;ILI0 MVoRINIMGESO;

(W) ABL938 MIBE3UBlLNMM NEYEOMEXIEIJ0 @YBUD.

(3) anens ®IL |O@IOM @RYQLUDIEERUBBHIDI,—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

(ag) moelmieEnses GUAMICIEO@, GUDEUOEMO, WMINDo, aldlaldriMo,
MoMI06Mo,  MIAMMIBREMo o)Al 9UWVOROSWIBY, og)MIT  O@IG M@0
06 |SIOMIOD, ag)g)o MOLNMIMVMIB:06M (IABOCMHMEBRRUBLN0;

(endl) SOOIGHANI®  MLIMINVMIBHOEMABIMNIAUUDIAID  Da IHO6MEBRUD
Q1683 @IMIo MuNda lleaan@Imo;

() @2ellmimomMis:0emMOBI@d o@deq]sidleanimm lameendnes @$lalo
@nolaye  adelle flesymalmeaenslayss  aldludleimomlmie  @005euoadl  aile:aum
al©lal0SleWdE)o;

()  aVBe9IB  ®oUIlB:Ale)  @ORIMITVMIE:EEMARMOD]  ENITWEeRS
DBREMERIEN0 (@ IQIGOMERBUDB0

DaIGWIUIICHHENZMIG).

15. 335-00 QI {ld) aldh®o o@D Qldla] Bal@LOE.—(EIWIM BRYBFIeel 335-00

Qe N ld00 IO O@IM Qldsle] G2IGGHEENZMILT), GRMOWD):—

“335. SHSHBOSWIo QI06MIE MV IMNEBRBIOSDI0 o lBlaV00  AOHIO
MV GHl BN DIMIBS 20MOQIEI®]o.—(1) 630600 HSWIHSD]o QIoemleay
MO INOBIOMDIe  aldlMde  AOBI@ID]  MVIEHIBEOMEMIe BO@IOG o IBlTVOOYD)

moellmio  Qlelleosj0lBGHEI MBBYHEWI  HOMIENGHEWI  §alQIMICIHNBH@0
@oogiElad @odlem oGl a@emssleo  moellmpe  aleileg cl@osmo
O8VICMI  SHOMIBHIEMI  Da IGRINDILNNS  @OMIAUGIHHIDIOIBOIHDY0  6).216QYENBT)
9SNWOSEWI HEOBQINBHIVNMFEWI DMMOUIEI®)] MODIBleeM@I6M).

(2) (1)-00 2alaidlaflorl aIMNGWGs QlloyeLad] o@o®®ilene @YD
IR ajeaIary BENIOW S |SODD, OMVE@S0l6H60, OIVE@SOI @IS0
2NDEINSIOMI® HEBRWAVAGMI BROMOVo QUBHNHIWIOS BA@ @PYIWIVo Oal alle
2RACMIQUAN @I,

(3) (2)-90 9l i@ lB000 2NNOME]SISI8S alle, @R 2OV Gl
DO al@lme@l Glairomlmsslod GRSEHEeMEMo @R 1000 @RS ENM DI Qfl$al
QO)OBIOM, OAVE@SA]l, BPIWBOBODMIND  ag)S}BNIRM AF MSalSIS:UBHE BoUo
QIO AUlWODI@D, GVl HB MSalSle:Ud @RYDVOEIBHENEMIMIET).

allvoGle06mo.—s®  Qlda{lond  EYAUVIOMICRIBEHOD],  ‘@SHUY’,  ‘QIemlely

NJalMo’ ag)aml QOB UDH6) @LOO(B> Mo 1960-0e1 GHH03 DHSHBYo

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




13

QI0eMIRIMNIaIMeaBgle  @GRlad  (1960-0e1 34) @RS M@MSIVIHSS @PE®
@PAOMNEERUY 96NZOIOlHnM@I6M.”.

16. 337-00 Q1) {l0) al®0 o PDID Qldla] BalBLOD.—(EIWIM BRBFIeel 337-00

QB {lNald:00 @IS alO@IAM Adsle] GalBEHHEMZMIETY, BOGIWD):—

“337. 9al6@oUila] SAISS0 Sald®) TVOLIEBBRSICLIGHN)  £3LIDUOWEBRSICLICH6)D

B91HOIMN O OSD@.—(1) @WIODI0IB}o aBOMEsIER0 AUlES, 210@, O®ILIOD), GaNISDD,

oeqyooay, afls, Ao  MuNdalMo, @U@ @PeEIBIEdE 0Q TLNdaIMERUd
a@mlaI@  dlmyss  mellmeselo, ©ald®} @ORIEN}I0LBUWD, GOOW, MO,
©al0M)TUOLl0, LU0  GBVHLIBICE ReINIdWo  oag)IailseanSlerIns) R91HE6))G:EWI
B91ONOM @OMAUGIE}@EI BROLIBIT BOOMOo aldlToarsled Mlam @POm©o
9a16@IUIla] ©AUS8Bo  BNYBNUOM  @EMAUGIENG®:EWI  ERELBIG  @R@IMN]
BD06MAIB}BHEDI 6)2IQYID aldSIEJOTCH@IE).

(2) (1)-00 2alQidla{lorl AIIMNGUE eloaeileenm oBe®o0dsglan@ie enad
OMVEE@S0lBs @PQYIV]00 DIV BHIOWICDMo ag)MIB @PMUBGIMID00 Oal@@d
SU@IODH®MOD oll® 21}AOHOQMN @6,

(3) OMV@SOBS, o@BEOO®BIEo Sald®] GOIWIGLIGHD &BISWICLIGHSD
omOQIIGRICHe0  @PERBIM  MEQEM®BIERe  ©ald@MTUALIGOMEHI  @RELJ®E;IED
£2e1000W6BRSIERIGHS0 NEIMEILIo B30 @PMAIGlENMM «BO®EIEN0 §6alGa]0 SYEENIO
@eEEla negem®Eslele MIBRENI BVSWHNQIIEMI MSIAIEMI GELIBIT  Mileso
©.21QQI2EMI emoglay MGEUM @O0 al@lrooTsileng DSHCWIBSI
6 GHAUUDBNIOEMIESI MIBEZUTlLHIARM 6.

(4) (3)-90 9alQld o i l00m88 MIBEZUDo LIEle) a@O@MO0I8}e MIGEZUD0 LIEl]
a®¥ Glairvomlmasiad @eomoo Mlde3u06RUB aldeilersnsmRmio GROMOo MIGE3UDEBRUD
alelleaym@lad  @o@owd  afldalnineml@om, eauE:sdl, (2)-00 alQidla] (16000
Mle@lae0am o@e®sslee MSaISI®UWES Bowo QIOIOD, GPOMOo &&ala], Syent
@oLRIBI0 g MOBWEERUD BPSWENEGHEWI MISIEEWI BVSLIEBIIGE MlBso 6).21Q)EEWI
ealeQemr®io O®I el IO} IIBML  ealeld]  @oogldd  mlanio
EDMSIBHENIOAMI6M.”.

17. 340-00 Q1) {l0) al®®0 o DD Qldla] BalBLOD.—(EIWIM BRBFIeel 340-00

QB l0Y aldh@0 @O JOIMM Qldhla] Bal@BHEENZ®IEN), BRMIOY.—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




14

“340.  ©l0MIVOPLIEBSIGLIGHN0 V|00 quNeIEnRsIeeIeH6d  noeillmio
alellesjoloymalass  dleodwmoe.—(1) moeilmye  msymM@lmiealendl  963udleeeq]s

muneieEnsgleenslod  o®olaileeld  BISOICRID  @ald®MVALICOMI  @IHDIVIBo
a@eo®mlee  moellmpe  arilesgdloi@e®o  aelesdlat® AODIEHSIHE:EI
OSBLHEDWI  HOMIBNGHEWI H¥la)l MS}HERI BRELIBIT GROMOo (@ IAUCOMIBUD
821QMMINY HO0EMAINUBHEWI §.aIQPID aldSIEJOCDH@IBIIM.

2) MNBRDLIISS]  (@15:00600 @PEERIBITD  BHAVESO! @ lj06)e]S0lla)
MIBERUDEBRUD ERMYTVAIGD @BREJIOD WINMIVIBe aBOMEHIE0 M]G0 MNLIEERS]d
moellmie  aellegoloi@e®o  alellos0lem® QODIEHHSIBNGHEWI  MSBLHEI
HOMBNGHEWI  H¥la)l MS}HERI BOOLIBIT  @OOMDo  (IAUAOD]  ealQIan@Ia)
&006MMIANEGEI 621QIMB aldSIEJITD@IB:IM].

(3) (1)-00 DalaidloflorIe@O  (2)-00 9alQldla ORI  QAIITUNBUDBE)
allojeumo@l egom®ilee EBUD  (EIAIBOMIoOQIN  GENIDWIE]SOM, BAVESOIEHND
OM@30l MV BYAUUDOMICEISHIDV] (EIBD B0 BPWIHI06)|SIOTID  OEREPWILAGMI
@OOMO0 @RYSOS GADTE MTIVADo @PQYIVIDo Dot ail® aRA@MIQRM @I6M).

(4) (3)-90 9alQldla] (@180 2RAOMES adl$ BB 2RACTI® GG @D
al@lmerai  Glalnomlmssla  GPSEHNMRMY @R(EI:000 @RSDHENM@IM  afl$al
QUO)OBIOM, OTVESO], BOWIUBHBOMIND ag)SIENIAM @O0 MSalSIB:UdH6)

Boo QIDIOD, B ldMIB:aHTB MSalSIHUd @YVOEICHNMBDRI6N).”.

18. 3400q) Q1) {l0) ald®®0 oD Q)] BalBLOD.—(EIWIM BROBFeel 340ag)

QB l0) ald@0 MO JOIMM Qld)a ] BalGBHENZGIGN), BOMIDOY.—

“340ag) @oellmiead 2101600 oflude2e’s  AINImME9ES0  22e1000W6BBSlEo

£2LI8AVOONGSIE0  dledtHa leaam @88 dlerdwmo.—(1) @IODIVIBe Hald®]

REINIBPOMICEID  LREIDUOWODIGEID  REIGVIGRIIGEID MOLRIlMENd 2101600  allrudeeay
QAUNOHE9E80  AlEleo0lRI®HEI MS8)H:EWI @PGICRIHS MellMELlo B9IHNGHEWI
a@EOBIEN0  HHENMII Ml GPMICRISS HAI8Bo  BLYHOMW  @OMAIGlHHHEWI
@06l @ neilhezelo GPGIGERINS) &1 @PMIAIGlE}E:E6WI, MeRe® ;e llWwormGd
gelo nelNRIH6]E6I @BR6ELIH;ITD, BROMO0 B0} (IO §.2IRM @M BYSOODE;IE0
Taleeee@o Mleouilae@®ewo MIdenIMWlee@ewd 6aldle{lee@e@ ©.21QId
al0SIBOO@IB:M}.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




15

(2) (1)-00 92alQdla] (EIMHOOMBS &0} G)Qo GMHIOUNMIlenilslo 200
SDLJOOM@RODIBIEOM ®IRI6M).

(3) (-9 9alaldo{ldd  alEINBUIlENM  &)Qo S2IYIAN  aBODGIVIBlo
SIQMN0aINOBIEM@D aIGIMIDVI0o Ol B}0WINM@Lo @PMBal@IMIVIo e lt@I]@d
SUIeOOMSs8  allo@le @YD  MIMVODMI@  HJOWIHODo B0}  AUBHODITD

S0ll@Iem@M88 S M@E;] UBleHl B89 |eSEME@MO6T).”.

19. 3406nil QI {lAY 01800 o DI Qldhle] GaIBLO@.—(EIWIM BBOBFleel 340enil

QB l0) ald 00 I JODIAM Qldla] BalGBHHENZMIGN), BRMIDOY.—

“340enil.  @oellmead  0llVB2EINIMENEBI  6)06N3)Ca 10 @IA)Y

9a16@IUIla) Q10a0Mo o ilSIeL]S)EeeIl0 BEMEIOG:SER.—(1) D BPERLPVOTIMT &lslenss

80} HQBIMO VAIQIMDIMSS DERUDIEOMINSEWI  BOIBNEMMINSEWI  MILIlMEAD
ailnvdeesy QUM OO ESO al0MMOLIODILIHSEDO a0 mMMIOOMILRHSEWI
SO BNIENBYCa 0B} DO @LOAID @ (@100 mlesHailoaymalad
Dale@IUa|®IMNIEUDHo DIBIOG GaldBHMEDO @RYHEMAN MPAID] MoUdDIB6ID
&006MA88 &0} QPANMEOO® GPHLIBITD  @IMalI@OOD®, OAVGSOIEWO D
@AUIODIGEIENID]  HTV@S0l  @PUlB:000siomI@  mMladle peidlalleel 6o
96BORWMNEMO, aVeN]  MWBMVeIRNES olBQlDI@ 0O &0}  Gatoeflmy
963PWINNEMI allSlera)sieeanenzmle, @oWle:clom@ss aueni allailavem@d asdlmiesq
DB lOE aNILBDIBHE)ENBMINIE).

(2) @REMHEMODIN) GUDaHo, DD BPERLPVOMIM HISle8s o@e®esle)o
BIQBIMIGBRUD  ©2IQOM  QADaOMo  BVHLIBHIM  @IMald@o  DalEWOUilajlgieensam
aflvomilesom  mP@ao®  @ooemmeemsam  aveni  allailaem@d  aedlmissglay
BENIDWIO|30@,  @EBOM  ollSlosSiIom  QaOMo  GEEERERIT  WIMald@o
BB SOAM Mo, BRELJITMaldHo, MY AlSINTIEBENBERAOE.

(3)  QARAOMOMIHMPEWI  WIMaI@ODIHAFEWI  OSAWEHI  BSEJE;I@D
@I MVIMIGEMI @R®) A ilSle)2|S;EM® @PAIBHEE—

(i) QI0a0MEA0 @OMald(@EMD 6NV &O06MMOQ
MoNBBHOBLNCa] @PWINS BOEIIMEI0 BV 2 1eE:06NE 6303 BMISIMY M@BIHOD}o;
H)SOOD

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




16

(i) SENBILBHFOMIBS B006MOMIHMMIO, EGMISIMII@ AlBmnIssSlVISI8s
MPDAI®  MVAROTIMSSI@, @PWIWVAHS  alODIAUIMSSD® IOV MPVAID
@IV NTBSHIND]0

DD Qldla] @100 oGO0 QIOMEAI WIMalI(@MEAD GHENOBHIVOMIBS OMOQT
1306 |S1ile60m aldslgloam@oeT).

(4) adlSIoaiSo®  QIAOMODIGED @IMal@OMIERId @dellniead alQIGND
@oegml@d  allivdmesiend 988  qLMBAESEBRSIGE,  QIDAOMEAD  IMalI(@EAD
allslessieam @oud, @EGado SIV@SOIWeLIBIT, BOMOo allslessieec 9smd
OMVE@S0lO® BRAlIWIEEEMm®0, DD BRELPODIM KIS og)SIENIRM aBemeslelo
MSalSlUBHE GoWo QIEIOD, QIAOMABIOMFEDWI  WIMaI@OMIHAFEWI  OSAWHS
ealelafl@d moellmye, 2118 @pegiEldd allnude’e’eErud emVE»sol Mleso 6aleRemrmyo
WEEROM MNP0 H2QPMDIMIS8  alelallo @PQID00 ORIV HAl@IC® ollo®io
OIVE@ S0l 95A@ MIMo MHVSIEHHMNBEMIEM.

(5) QILaOMEDO @IMalI@ERD  BHEMBDBSIAN  Mo@IVI@ @R  6elLlo
®aleQEMBMo  @REROM  LIEleM ®id  MLImIMIG06m  anensleelas  aloal

QAUQCHHENBOIAI6).”.

20. 345-00 QIB)alM88 EENTI.—@IWOM @YB:QIeEl 345-00 QUd{l@D, “GoWIUI,

340ag) Q) flom W@ 2udeq|siMIlgoe@esldd” )M QIOHBUDHN)o
aflaO®IMIo @PEOBRUBENL0 CRAHHODIMe ald:Oo “GR@IUBHE), HD BPELOVOTITD
MOQICISOMo  UBlRHODIMIP M@ DISIEPOWBIB” ag)I  ADBN®:Ble  allamaijo
GalQCHSENZMIGM).

21. 345a) o)aN o NI QIBhla] G2IGLO@. —IWIM @YBFIeel 345-00 Qldoflay
GUDaHo @ISO Qldhla] GalGEHRENBMIEN), GRMIWD).—

“345a0). oil® 2AODIAN @ TLoeNITWLa) 01K0INNNG:08.—(1) 340-00 QUd}eflene 340

af) Qldaflelo al00ndudlaflgiss (leHe:uwd s¥losss DY @PERLIPVOBIM Blsleel
@IMID] all®@)o—

() @@ aRAOMOID  HOVEMMIW  MoNMIB®HOBHNOla]  GOWIOS
6O6UIMEI0 @Ol 2)}6)d:061TE &0} BMISIMT MTBIH@D]0; BhYSIOD

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




17

(ii) @O) 21)AODOMSS &006MODMIaNMIe0, emoglal@d
QUBONLSDIFI88  MPOAO®  LAOBIMSSIT,  CE@IUBHE)  alOWIAUOMBBO)
a10@}NI0M 630} @RAITVOO MNMTIBIND]o

OAVE@ S0l 23AOMIMB aldSIEJOOM@®I6M).

(2) (1)-00 QalQidla] @1000 alle MlunuleeM MBI, HAVE@SA
@O@I@ 9UdeSldlesmm moeilmiodleon aleRejo GregEl@ @osal, afls, 6.n05®3,
QIQIAVO@o, AQ MLNJaIMEBBUD a)MMIAUWIHS @0, AUERa]o, MUOIMo BHISIOD, TVBHIAQ
O®ICLIBHOVI] DENBIBNBEWI o j06)0]S}0ME}BHEWI §21DVMISB8S oRO®BIER0 2168303
@685l MBYMIBEGUOEBRUD o)A BEMESHLISIEHNENEZMOET).

(3) 29 BPELPVODIMB BB 2BACTI oBO@IO} afleio 538enil QId:a{l@d
a10003UBlISI8S (@18:000 E)ald@MIBNDI B)SIERlG:OWN GaldeL! DVSICHLHENZMIEM).”.

22. 509-00 Qld}o lN88 RERVMI.—(@I1WIM @B:Fleel 509-00 Q@ |l@d,—

(i) (1)-00 2alaidafl@d “390” ag)am @PHOODTIN Mdat “326aV], 327, 335, 337,
340,” ag)0MN @RENEERBL0 @RGHHOU0 2llaMEBBRS0 G2IBELHENZ®I6ENT;

(ii) (6)-00 Dalaldo{l@d “390” ag)in @RSOHOWIMN Ml “326al, 327, 335, 337,
340,” ag)0M @RBNEBBSBo @OGHHONU0 2llaMEBBRSo GalBBHENZMI6ENT;

(iii) (7)-00 DalQiB)afl@d “390” agyam @RHOODIM Mmdat “326l, 327, 335, 337,

340,” ag)0M GRANEEBSBI0 @RGHHOQU0 2llaMNEBBRS0 CalBBHOENBDIEN).

23. 565-00 Qo 88 6EENML.—@IWIM BOG:GInLRI 565-00 Q@ {l@d,—

() (2)-90 2010 fl@ (@) QUIEMWOBMIMIEUDAH @INY|O@IAN  EUEMUEBBUD
GalBCHSHENZMIGM), BODIVDY:—

“(all) @oELPDOo XVIag)-DIBB lGmRIesIXISI8s Moeilmy Momie:0emaR@I]
ENIMWS |3 QlleH@EB3UI;

(weRyy) 1986-ee1 aidlaudl®l (MVosHem) @B:QIMe  (1986-081 29-00
BB O&Y) GOOIM  SIFID  2emIeslulsIss al1sERUdes)  allswmowl
Mldmoem-0a108lee@  moellmyeenud,  -moellnyeenud,  wolallm — moellmnyeanrud,

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




18

@al®HSSHONID  1NIBalld:  Mmoeilmiednrud, oJoayle;  moeilmieanud, @amoerilmieerUd

ag)MIQI@I@OI] eNIMWEq ]S QilaH@EBRUD.”;

(i) (4)-00 9alQIB) @ “BOEMMA ©JIEWIBL” ag)IM  QUIBNUDBE)  aldh®o

“al®MIDI0o BJaIB@IVO” af)M QUIBNGUD BalBBHENBMIGN).

24. 570-00 QB }o lNI88 RERODI.—(I1WIM @YB:FIeE! 570-00 Qb @3, —

() (@) aUeMLOMIT “BREMMIO} 0ICWIV” af)MN  QAUILNG:UDBS)  aldh®o
“al®INO@0o 0} IEIVO” ag)(M QUIBNGHBlo “GPMIM] 0JalEIB0” af)(M QUIIHENHUBHE)

ald»0o “MOIMNIO BIICWINO” af)(M AUIBNHBlo GalBBHENBMIE);

(i) (endl) aUEeMLOMIT “@PMIM] OIEWIBC” )M  QUIBNBHUBHS  aldh0o
“e0 N0 DJaIBIBO” o) QAUIBNGHUD BalBBHSENZMIGM).

25. 572-00 Qoo flmss  6EROGL—EIWIM G@&:gleel 572-00 Qldle], (1)-00
9alQldlofl@d,  “TUBHEHIB” o)  QOGSIM  GUdaHo,  “BEERIBIM  AVALSID
@PUWIB:006)0]S}OTI® 9EBPRNANE” ag)MN QIIBNG:UD BalBEHOENZMIE).

26. MOFID0 o ISIBHDEMNBR  ERRNMIL—(IWIM @OBQIOLI ML  alSlewilod

“0OWON6M UOlGHB:UD” ag)M UBlBHBODIMBHISI@ (1)-00 CHISODI@D,—
(i) 335-00 QIBe flom@len,—

(ag) (300 EHOSOWMI@ “OYNUDAIERSB  2lAI0)GS)e  @oellmieErs)o
@Ml DD 59BOQIFIBOIMD” ag)IM QAUILOBUBAE) ald:Do “@SHBIOSD0
QI06MIE3(N N0 IMEERBIHSDIo alBlVOo AUOMIID] MVIGHIBHIMSBS DODOQEIDI0”
20N QIDHNGUD GalBBHNENBMIG;

(endl) (4)-00 ECHISOWMIM “@PETMO ©lal” )N  QUIBNHUDHE  ald0o

“al®MOI0o @Jal” ag)aM QAUILNHUD  BalBEHENBMIGNT;

(i) 337-00 Qidajlo, @OOlMTIOO8s (3), (4) og)M] s8RRSO
9UBBNOla }@8l0 B¥10I0BHENI®IEN);

(i) 339-00 Qi floMTIOO (4)-00 6HISOMI@ “eLO}MIG ERMUD BYat” ag)OM

QOBNGUDHE) aldhDo “@PRID00 BYal” ag)(M AUIBOLD:UD GalBCHOEMBDI6N);

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




19

(iv) 340-00 aidloflon@eo (4)-00 6HISOMIGE “EeMz0l0o  ®)at”  ag)aM
QDENDHUBHE) ald0o “al®IMIDII0o O)al” a)IM QAUIBO}BHUD BalGEHHENZMIG).

@0lal M}aOMAE 61003,
DQUICGPD.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




20

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA

Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION

No. 64/Leg. C1/2023/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 8th December, 2023
22nd Vrischikam, 1199

17th Agrahayana, 1945.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in English

language of the Kerala Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance, 2023 (3 of 2023).

By order of the Governor,

K. G. SANAL KUMAR,
Law Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




21

[Translation in English of “2023-ee1 6&08 oyMlmilajoeildl (6eEUG)
6308WlmMadMY” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 3 OF 2023

THE KERALA MUNICIPALITY (AMENDMENT)
ORDINANCE, 2023

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-fourth Year of the Republic of India.

AN
ORDINANCE

further to amend the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994.

Preamble—WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994

for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take

immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the

Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the Kerala

Municipality ( Amendment) Ordinance, 2023.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Act 20 of 1994 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994 (20 of 1994) (hereinafter referred to as the principal

Act) shall have effect subject to the amendments specified in sections 3 to 26.

3. Amendment of section 58.—In sub-section (1) of section 58 of the principal Act, after the
words and symbol “welfare programmes,” the words and symbol “waste management,” shall be

inserted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




22

4. Insertion of Chapter XVIA.—After section 325 of the principal Act and above the heading
“Management of waste ” ,“CHAPTER XVIA” shall be inserted.

5. Insertion of new section 3254.—In the principal Act, after the heading “CHAPTER
XVIA, Management of waste ”, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

b

“325A. Definition.—For the purpose of this chapter and section 58, “waste management
means the segregation, collection, transportation, storage, processing or disposal of waste,

including solid waste.

Explanation—Words and expressions used in this chapter and not defined, but defined in
the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986), and the rules made thereunder,

shall have the same meanings respectively assigned to them in the said Act and the rules.”.
6. Amendment of section 326.—In section 326 of the principal Act,—
(1) for sub-section (1a), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1a) All the duties, responsibilities, and functions of the municipality pertaining to
waste management as provided in this chapter and the rules made under this Act, and in the
Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986), and the rules made thereunder, shall
vest with the council, and the council shall discharge its duties, responsibilities and functions

through the Secretary.”;

(i1) after sub-section (1a), so substituted, the following sub-section, shall be inserted,

namely:—

“(laa) It shall be the responsibility of the Secretary to discharge the duties,
responsibilities and functions of the Municipality under sub-section (1a), and the Secretary may
by order in writing entrust the said duties to officers and employees having the charge of waste
management, public health, sanitation and engineering or any other officers or employees of the
Municipality, on the basis of streets or areas or the nature of work, and ensure that such duties,

responsibilities and functions are duly discharged by them.”.
(ii1) for sub-section (3) the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) The Municipality may directly or through any person or agency or on contract

basis or otherwise, make arrangements in whole or in part, for carrying out waste management

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




23

activities under this Act and the rules made thereunder or the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986

(Central Act 29 of 1986) and the rules made thereunder .”.

7. Insertion of new sections after section 326.—After section 326 of the principal Act, the

following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“326 A. Council to carry out Government directions.—(1) It shall be the responsibility
of the council to carry out directions issued by the Government in pursuance of the solid waste
management under this Act or the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986)

or the rules made thereunder.

(2) The Chairperson shall ensure that the agenda prepared in connection with the
directions issued under sub-section (1) is placed before the council in its next meeting and the

council shall take decision on such agenda .

(3) In cases where the council fails to take decision in accordance with the directions
issued under sub-section (1) within one month of the receipt of the same, it shall be deemed that

permission for carrying out such directions has been approved or given by the council.

(4) The Secretary shall immediately take steps to implement such decisions,
including the deemed approval under sub-section (3), and if there is any failure or default by the
Secretary or any other responsible officer in implementing such decision, the Government may
initiate disciplinary action against the Secretary or such officer, considering it as dereliction of

duty.

(5) If the council fails to comply with the directions of the Government under
sub-section (1), the Government may, impose fine on the council, without prejudice to any other

actions that may be initiated against the council:

Provided that a reasonable opportunity of being heard shall be given to the council before

imposing the said fine.

326B. Responsibilities of Secretary on waste management.—(1) The Secretary may
initiate legal actions against any person who contravenes the provisions of this chapter and may

compound offences which are compoundable under this Act or the rules made thereunder.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




24

(2) The Secretary shall have all the powers for effectively carrying out the
responsibilities regarding the waste management under this chapter or any other law for the time

being in force.

(3) The Secretary may, in exigencies after informing the chairperson, expend an
amount not exceeding two lakh rupees out of the municipal fund concerned, for discharging the
functions vested with him under this chapter or any other law for the time being in force relating

to waste management.

326C. Responsibility to handover segregated waste to the Municipality or authorised
agency.—(1) It shall be the responsibility of every household, owners, occupiers of any premises,
hotel, restaurant, industry, hospital or any other establishment to hand over or deposit segregated
waste in the designated location and pay the user fee to the municipality or authorised agency as

directed by the Secretary through public notice.

(2) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than one thousand rupees
but not exceeding ten thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions under sub-

section (1).

326D. Provisions relating to user fee—(1) Each Municipality shall fix a user fee, to
meet the whole or part of the cost for providing services in connection with segregation, collection,
transportation, storage, processing and disposal of waste on every waste generator and collect

the same in the manner as may be specified by the municipality:

Provided that if the Government have fixed the rate for user fee, the council shall not fix a

rate less than the rate fixed by the Government.

(2) Each waste generator shall pay the user fee to the Municipality or to any
authorised agency before the last date of every month or within such period as may be decided by

the Municipality.

(3) If any waste generator fails to pay the user fee as provided under sub-section (2),

it shall be recovered, together with fine at the rate of fifty percent per month.

Provided that such fine shall be recovered only where such user fee has not been remitted

even after the expiry of ninety days from the specified date.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




25

(4) The user fee together with the fine shall be recovered as arrears of public revenue

as specified in section 538 B.

(5) The Secretary, without prejudice to any other action that may be taken against the
defaulter of the user fee, may refuse to provide any service from the Municipality to such defaulter

until the user fee is paid.

(6) The Government or in accordance with the guidelines as may be issued by the
Government from time to time, the Municipality may, exempt any waste generator or class of
waste generators or owners or occupiers of any unoccupied or vacant buildings, from the payment

of user fee in whole or in part.”.

8. Substitution of new section for section 327 —For section 327 of the principal Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“327. Duties of waste generators for storage and deposit of solid waste.—(1) It shall be
the duty of each waste generator to provide separate bins or receptacles of the size and colour, as
may be prescribed in the rules or bye laws or as may be specified by the Secretary, for the purpose

of storage of biodegradable, non-biodegradable and domestic hazardous waste.

(2) Such bins or receptacles shall always be kept in good condition and shall be
provided in such numbers and at such places as the Secretary may, from time to time, direct by

public notice.

(3) Each waste generator shall segregate and deposit the waste, as specified in the
rules or bye laws, for easy collection and disposal of such waste by the employees or contractors

engaged by the Municipality.

(4) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than one thousand rupees
but not exceeding ten thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions under sub-

section (3).”.
9. Amendment of section 328.—In section 328 of the principal Act,—

(1) for the marginal heading the following marginal heading shall be substituted,

namely:—

“Contract with waste generator or owner or occupier for the removal of waste”;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




26

(i1) in the existing provision, for the words “the owner or occupier of any premises to
remove rubbish or filth”, the words “the waste generator or owner or occupier of any premises for

the removal of waste” shall be substituted.

10. Substitution of new section for section 329.—For section 329 of the principal Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“329. Door to door collection of waste.—(1) Each Municipality, in the municipal area,
shall arrange door to door collection of segregated waste from all households, settlements,
commercial institutions and other non-residential premises and in the case of multi-storied
buildings, large commercial complexes, malls, housing complexes, etc. from the entry gate or any

other location as may be specified by the Secretary through public notice.

(2) Segregated waste collected as per sub-section (1) shall not be transported or

brought for treatment or disposal unless it is properly covered.”.
11. Amendment of section 331.—In section 331 of the principal Act,—
(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) A Municipality that does not have a solid, liquid, sewage, or faecal sludge
treatment plant but possess vacant land within or outside the municipal area shall undertake

projects for the setting up of such plants or facilities on the said land on top priority.”;

(i1) after sub-section (1), so substituted, the following sub-sections shall be inserted,

namely:—

“(1a) Each Municipality shall identify suitable private land within or outside the
municipal area for the purpose of waste management, if necessary, acquire the land under the Right
to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and Resettlement Act,

2013 (Central Act 30 of 2013) or by land relinquishment or on lease or through private purchase.

(1b) The land acquired by the Municipality under the sub-section (1a) shall not be

used for any other purpose without the prior sanction of the Government.

(1c) Each Municipality shall give priority to utilise its own vacant land or land vested

in it for waste management activities where the land is available for the same.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




27

(1d) The Municipality shall take all possible steps to resume waste management
activities on the land, which was previously utilized for such activities but remains unused due to

various reasons:

Provided that such land shall not be diverted or utilised for any other purposes or activities

without prior sanction of the Government.”;

(i1) in sub-section (2), for the words, symbol, bracket and figure “notifying the land
under sub-section (1)”, the words, symbol, bracket, figure and letter “identifying the land under

sub-section (1a) shall be substituted.

12. Insertion of new sections after section 332.—After section 332 of the principal Act, the

following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“332A. Setting up of joint waste management projects.—The Municipality may, if the
Council so decides or if so required by the Government, set up joint waste management projects
with any other Local Self Government Institution on such terms and conditions, as may be agreed
by such Local Self Government Institutions, subject to the guidelines as may be issued by the

Government in this regard.

332B. Municipality to make arrangement for conducting regular inspection and
monitoring.—It shall be the responsibility of the municipality to make arrangements for
conducting regular inspections and monitoring of the waste management activities and projects
in the municipality to ensure that it is being operated or implemented in compliance with the

required standards and in accordance with the relevant laws.

332C. Responsibilities of individuals and rewards for reporting offences—(1) Any
person may report before the Secretary regarding any violation of the provisions in this chapter or
any offence relating to waste management, including littering, dumping or throwing waste into

public places and water bodies.

(2) Subject to the guidelines as may be issued by the Government, from time to time,
the Municipality may give rewards to persons who report violations and offences under

sub-section (1).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




28

(3) Any person who maliciously or intentionally makes a false report under
sub-section (1) to harm or cause loss to another person shall, on conviction, be punished with fine

which may extend to ten thousand rupees.

332D. Beneficial provisions for residents near to waste treatment Centres.—(1) The
Municipality may, subject to the rules or guidelines as may be made or issued by the Government,
provide incentives, including but not limited to tax exemptions or relaxations or welfare schemes

to the residents in the immediate vicinity of centralised waste treatment centres or disposal sites.

(2) The Municipality may establish convenient and beneficial facilities such as parks,
playgrounds, recycling facilities, swap shops and physical training facilities, for the well-being
and recreational opportunities of the residents in the vicinity of centralised waste treatment centres

or disposal sites.”.

13. Amendment of section 333.—In section 333 of the principal Act, the existing provision
shall be numbered as sub-section (1) thereof, and after sub-section (1) so numbered, the following

sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2) No person shall organise an event or gathering of more than one hundred persons
at any unlicensed place without intimating the Municipality, at least three working days in advance
and such person or the organiser of such event shall ensure segregation of waste at source and
handing over of the same to the waste collector or agency as specified by the Municipality on such

fees as may be fixed by the Municipality:

Provided that such fees shall not be less than the actual rate of cost for the management of

such waste and the same shall be paid in advance as directed by Municipality.”.

14. Substitution of new section for section 334 C.—For section 334 C of the principal Act,

the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“334C. Constitution of Waste Management Fund.—(1) Each Municipality shall
constitute a fund, by name, “Waste Management Fund”, and it shall be managed in accordance

with the rules made or guidelines issued by the Government .

(2) The following shall be credited to the Waste Management Fund, namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




29

(a) amounts recovered as fine or penalty in connection with violations of waste

management;

(b) contributions received from Corporate Social Responsibility (CSR) funds for

the purpose of waste management;
(c) sponsorship amounts or any other contributions received for this purpose;
(d) any other amount as specified by the Government.
(3) The Fund shall be utilised for the following purposes,—

(a) all waste management activities, including but not limited to segregation,

collection, transportation, management, processing, and disposal of waste;

(b) purchase and installation of equipments necessary for effective waste

management;

(c) training and capacity development programmes to enhance the skills and

knowledge of employees engaged in waste_management;

(d) any other activities related to waste management as approved by the

Government.”.

15. Substitution of new section for section 335.—For section 335 of the principal Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“335. Responsibility to keep the premises of shops and commercial establishments
clean.—(1) It shall be the responsibility of the owner or occupier of each shop and commercial
establishment to keep its premises clean and not to throw, litter, deposit or burn any waste on its

premises or allow customers to throw, litter, deposit or burn any waste on its premises.

(2) The Secretary or an officer specially authorised by the Secretary for the purpose
may, on being satisfied that any person has acted in contravention of the provisions in sub-section

(1), impose a fine of five thousand rupees on such person.

(3) The fine imposed under sub-section (2) shall be remitted within fifteen days from
the date of its imposition and in default of such payment, the Secretary shall initiate prosecution

proceedings without prejudice to any other actions that may be taken against him.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




30

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, the words ‘shops’, ‘commercial establishment’
shall have the same meanings respectively assigned to them in the Kerala Shops and Commercial

Establishments Act, 1960 ( 34 of 1960).”.

16. Substitution of new section for section 337 —For section 337 of the principal Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“337. Prohibition of draining of used water into public places or water bodies.—(1) No
person shall drain or allow to drain waste water from any sink, drain, stable, hotel, restaurant,
household, industry, hospital or other establishment into any public drain, road, street or public

place or water body or water course or allow or cause to drain such used water out of such premises.

(2) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than five thousand rupees
but not exceeding fifty thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions under

sub-section (1).

(3) The Secretary may, by notice, direct the owner or occupier of such premises to
close or shut or remove any pipe or tube or other means by which used water is allowed to flow

into any public road, drain or street or any other public place or water bodies.

(4) Any person who has been given a direction under sub-section (3) shall comply
with such directions within a period of seven days of its receipt and if he fails to comply with such
directions, the Secretary shall, without prejudice to the actions that may be taken under sub-section
(2), close, shut or remove such pipe, tube or other means and shall recover the actual expenditure

incurred for such removal from him.”.

17. Substitution of new section for section 340.—For section 340 of the principal Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340. Prohibition of throwing waste into public places or private places.—(1) No person
shall throw, litter, deposit, burn or bury any waste on any street, drain or public place that is not

intended for such use, or caused such acts to be done.

(2) No person shall throw, litter, deposit, burn or bury any waste in any private places
or caused to do such acts, otherwise as prescribed or in accordance with the directions issued by

the Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




31

(3) The Secretary or an officer specially authorised by the Secretary for the purpose
may, on being satisfied that any person has acted in contravention of the provisions in sub-sections

(1) or (2), impose on the spot, a fine of five thousand rupees on such person.

(4) The fine imposed under sub-section (3) shall be remitted within fifteen days from
the date of its imposition and in default of such payment, the Secretary shall initiate prosecution

proceedings, without prejudice to any other actions which may be taken against him.”.

18. Substitution of new section for section 340A.—For section 340 A of the principal Act,

the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340A. Prohibition of depositing waste or rubbish or excreta in water bodies and water
sources.—(1) No person shall throw or deposit waste or rubbish or excreta in a water course,
water body or water source or allow or cause to flow water from any latrine or allow waste water
to flow into it or pollute the water in any other way or engage or depute or compel or instigate

any person to do such activity.
(2) An offence under sub-section (1) shall be cognizable and non-bailable.

(3) Whoever commits an offence referred to in sub-section (1), shall, on conviction,
be punishable with fine which shall not be less than ten thousand rupees but not exceeding fifty
thousand rupees and with imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than six months but not

exceeding one year.”.

19. Substitution of new section for section 340 B.—For section 340 B of the principal Act,

the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340B. Seizure and confiscation of the vehicle used for carrying waste or excreta.—(1)
The Secretary or an officer of the Municipality authorised by the Secretary in this behalf or a Police
Officer not below the rank of Sub-Inspector shall seize a vehicle or vessel carrying waste or
excreta through public place or public road with the intention or preparation to commit an oftfence
under this chapter or having reasonable cause to suspect that the vehicle or vessel is on its return
after being used for such deposit, and shall produce before the Sub Divisional Magistrate having

jurisdiction.

(2) After conducting inquiry, if the Sub Divisional Magistrate is satisfied that there is

reasonable ground to believe that the vehicle or vessel has been used for committing any offences

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




32

under this chapter, the vehicle or vessel so seized may be confiscated, and in any other case, it

shall be released.

(3) No order confiscating any vehicle or vessel shall be made under this section unless

the owner of such vehicle or vessel or the person from whom it is seized,—

(1) is given a notice in writing informing him, the grounds on which the vehicle or

vessel is to be confiscated; and

(i1) is given an opportunity of being heard against the ground of confiscation

within such reasonable time as may be specified in the notice.

(4) In cases where the vehicle or vessel seized contains waste, rubbish or excreta, the
person seizing the vehicle or vessel, if he is not the Secretary, shall immediately inform the
Secretary of such seizure, and the Secretary shall, without prejudice to any action that may be
taken under this chapter, dispose of such waste, rubbish or excreta at the expense of the owner of
the vehicle or vessel, and the Secretary shall recover the cost of such disposal together with a fine

not exceeding five thousand rupees from the owner.

(5) Where the vehicle or vessel is confiscated, it shall be auctioned and the amount

so received shall be credited to the Waste Management Fund.”.

20. Amendment of section 345.—In section 345 of the principal Act, for the words, figure
and letter “and which does not fall under the purview of section 340A”, the words “for which no

punishment is provided elsewhere in this chapter” shall be substituted.

21. Insertion of new section 3454.—After section 345 of the principal Act, the following

section shall be inserted, namely:—

“345A. Provisions regarding imposition of fine.—(1) No fine under this chapter, except
penalty specified in sections 340 and 340A shall be imposed by the Secretary unless the person

concerned,—

(1) is given a notice in writing informing him of the grounds on which the fine is

to be imposed; and

(11) is given an opportunity of being heard within such reasonable time as may be

specified in the notice.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




33

(2) While fixing the fine under sub-section (1), the Secretary shall consider the size
or quantity of the waste involved, the category, size and location of the household, hotel, industry

or other establishment and any rules or guidelines as may be made or issued by the Government

in this behalf.

(3) Any fine imposed under this chapter shall be recovered as arrears of public

revenue as specified in section 538 B.”.
22. Amendment of section 509.—In section 509 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), before the figure “390” the figures, letter and symbols “326C, 327,
335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted;

(i1) in sub-section (6), before the figure “390 the figures, letter and symbols “326C,
327,335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted;

(ii1) in sub-section (7), before the figure “390 the figures, letter, and symbols “326C,
327, 335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted.

23. Amendment of section 565.—In section 565 of the principal Act,—
(1) in sub-section (2) after clause (u) the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—
“(v) matters relating to waste management as specified in chapter XVI A;

(w) matters relating to construction demolition waste, e-waste, sanitary waste,
domestic hazardous waste, plastic waste and liquid waste subject to the Environment (Protection)
Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986) and the rules made thereunder.”;

(i1) in sub-section (4) for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “ten thousand

rupees” shall be substituted.
24. Amendment of section 570.—In section 570 of the principal Act,—

(1) in clause (a), for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees”

and for the words “fifty rupees” the words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(i) 1in clause (b), for the words “fifty rupees” the words “two hundred rupees” shall be

substituted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




25. Amendment of section 572.—In sub-section (1) of section 572 of the principal Act, after

the word “Government”, the words “or an officer authorised by the Government” shall be inserted.

26. Amendment of Fourth Schedule.—In the Fourth Schedule of the principal Act, under the

heading “Penalties” in column (1),—
(1) against section 335,—

(a) in column (3), for the words” Improper disposal of carcasses rubbish and filth”
the words “Responsibility to keep the premises of shops and commercial establishments clean”

shall be substituted;

(b) in column (4), for the words “Rupees five hundred” the words “Rupees ten

thousand” shall be substituted;
(i1) section 337 and the entries against it in columns (3) and (4) shall be omitted;

(ii1) against section 339, in column (4), for the words “Rupees two hundred and fifty”

the words “Rupees five thousand” shall be substituted;

(iv) against section 340, in column (4), for the words “Rupees two thousand” the words

“Rupees ten thousand” shall be substituted.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2023  puz ey

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

Digitally signed by Veeran T
Date:2023.12.09 11:48:38 +05:30




		2023-12-09T11:48:38+0530
	Veeran T




