


REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
ON
THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2021
AND
THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

Presented on 6 August, 2021

©
Kerala Legislature Secretariat
2021

KERALA NIYAMASABHA PRINTING PRESS.



REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
ON
THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2021
AND
THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

1205/2021.



CONTENTS

Page
1. Composition : 5
2. Report : 7
3. Appendix: I
(i) Minutes of Dissent I : 11
(i1) Minutes of Dissent II : 13

4. Appendix: I  Bill as reported by the Subject Committee : 15



SUBJECT COMMITTEE VIII
(ECONOMIC AFFAIRS)
(2021-2023)
Composition

Chairman :
Shri K. N. Balagopal,
Minister for Finance.
Ex-officio Members :

Shri M. V. Govindan Master,
Minister for Local Self Governments, Rural Development and Excise,

Shri V. N. Vasavan,
Minister for Co-operation and Registration.

Members :

Shri K. Babu (Thripoonithura)

DRr. K.T. Jaleel

Shri D. K. Murali

Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan

Shri Thottathil Ravindran

Shri N. Samsudheen

Shri K. V. Sumesh

Shri E. K. Vijayan.

Legislature Secretariat :
Shri S. V. Unnikrishnan Nair, Secretary
Smt. Lima Francis, Joint Secretary
Smt. Bindu S. L., Deputy Secretary

Shri M. S. Sreekumar, Under Secretary.



APPENDIX |

THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2021

Report of the Subject Committee

The Kerala Finance Bill, 2021 (Bill No. 2) was referred to Subject
Committee VIII- Economic Affairs for joint consideration with Subject Committee
II- Land Revenue and Devaswom and Subject Committee XIV - Home Affairs.
The joint meeting of Subject Committee II, VIII and XIV considered the Bill
clause by clause and now submits this Report with the Bill as reported by the

Subject Committee annexed thereto.

2. The Kerala Finance Bill, 2021 was published as a Gazette Extraordinary
dated 9™ June, 2021. The Bill was introduced in the Assembly on 10% June, 2021
and was referred to Subject Committee VIII on 5% August, 2021 for joint

consideration with Subject Committee II and XIV.

3. The Committee considered the Bill clause by clause at the meeting held
on 5" August, 2021. The Committee recommends to adopt the Bill with the

following modifications:
Clause 1
For sub-clause (2) the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“ (2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act,—

(a) Sub-sections (3) and (4) of section 8 shall be deemed to have

come into force on the 1t day of August, 2021.

(b) sub-section (5) of section 8 shall be deemed to have come into
force on the I day of June, 2021, remaining provisions of section 8 shall come
into force on such date as the Government may, by notification in the official

Gazette, appoint:



Provided that different dates may be appointed for different provisions of
this section and any reference in any such provision to the commencement of this

Act shall be construed as a reference to the coming into force of that provision.

(c) the remaining sections of this Act, shall be deemed to have come

into force on the 10" day of June, 2021”.
Clause 2

in item (a) of sub-clause (3) of clause 2, for the words and figures, “ 3lst
August, 2021” , the words and figures “ 30™ November, 20217, shall be
substituted.

Clause 4
(D) In item (ii) of sub-clause (2),

(a) in sub-item (b) for the words and figures “ 30" June, 20217, the
words and figures “ 30™ September, 2021 shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-item (c), for the words and figures “ 31 July, 2021, the
words and figures “ 31 October, 2021 shall be substituted.

(2) In sub-clause (3),
(a) item (1), (2), (3), (4), (5 shall be renumbered as (i), (ii),
(ii1), (iv), (V);
(b) in sub-item (a) of item (iii) as so renumbered, for the words and

figures “3I* August, 20217, the words and figures “30" November, 2021”7 shall
be substituted.

Clause 6

In sub-clause (3), in item (a), for the words and figures “31I August, 20217,
the words and figures “ 30" November, 2021” shall be substituted.



Clause 9

in sub-clause (3), in item (a), for the words and figures “31% August, 20217,

the words and figures “30™ November, 2021” shall be substituted.
Clause 10

in sub-clause (3), in item (a), for the words and figures “31** August, 20217,

the words and figures “30" November, 2021” shall be substituted.
After clause 10 the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“11. Validation—(1) Notwithstanding the lapse of the Kerala Finance Bill,
2021 (Bill No. 280 of the Fourteenth Kerala Legislative Assembly) (hereinafter
referred to as the said Bill) and the cesser of force of law of the declared
provisions of the said Bill, anything done or any action taken, including levy and
collection of tax or duty, during the period from the 1% day of April, 2021 to the
9t day of June, 2021, by virtue of the declared provisions contained in the said
Bill, under the Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 (11 of 1957) or under the
Kerala Court Fees and Suits Valuation Act, 1959 (10 of 1960) or under the Kerala
General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of 1963) or under the Kerala Building Tax Act,
1975 (7 of 1975) or under the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 (15 of
1991) or under the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 2004) or under the
Kerala Finance Act, 2019 (5 of 2019) or under the Kerala Finance Act, 2020 (7 of
2020) (hereinafter referred to as the 'respective Acts'), as they stand amended by
the said Bill, shall be deemed to be and to have always been, for all purposes,
validly and effectively done or taken under the provisions of the respective Acts,

as if the said amendments had been in force at all material times.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in the respective Acts during the
period from I*t day of April, 2021 to the 9" day of June, 2021 during which the
declared provisions contained in the said Bill was in force, anything done or any

1205/202L



10

action taken by virtue of said provisions of the said Bill, shall be deemed to have
been validly done or taken under the respective Acts and no action shall lie against
any dealer or authority on the ground of short levy or refund of excess tax or duty
and tax or duty collected, if any, by a dealer or an authority, as the case may be,

shall be paid over to the Government.”
4. All other changes are either verbal or consequential.

5. The minutes of dissent and the Bill as reported by the Subject Committee
are appended.

Thiruvananthapuram, K. N. BALAGOPAL,
August 5, 2021. Chairman,
Subject Committee VIIL



APPENDIX |
alcimesola]’1

2021-0e1 &8 Wm0y MA@ @00 MBI &S1@le: aldlesmmamnss
@YoMyl aYIM06em” (@JWIMA0Qo AYAIND 2IQIBlHSM®. M@ BEIMOmIeAI
DDHFHIOJTVOMYo &HQHONIW @OMINVOWe Gelo EHINW” &Hoelom1m” gmi” ®mean
MoMNIMo  (BGAHUNIW WMV (JDITVAWIVI@ af@dIDI@mmo. &1, ag)av. Sl
leaIss  ale1aIOMMOTIM”’ @RMEWIRINIW  A1T®IVIE MG aVoallwaImo
a0 LISl [lEsM@I@ MVABHNIB al0dRWEq]g. M@ MIBR® eMoglaya:u3
Moo NEWVNIGBH, MG BIVHM m(rﬂp)‘lem&;(m ®OOGS 010683@3, Q@3 ]m,
GSeM 632018 af)MIAUOH®  MLoNIAWaj" HMIMIW AflOIEEBUY MGG DS6aERIWw
@SITVO0M  $00YEBSEI Galogjo Aflg DMROWIGME. GRG0  &HOOEMEBBBOG
MoMOINOD1HMG M@ AGBMEN]G el &0al” Morafla). MEMINSIg]o
Ganoaflaw” M0a0al0 Y0 @S] QIMEaoud Mol afl@lai’ HGO
@olvawiolseiomllolesan. 2020-21  alBavocd =] eyt sl.ocd
@120 57.89% 20@a0em” aN0102)ga801000 AVIWLfIgES®. M)
afl@lal’ @@lavawl]enweaord Mle:@YImo  AUGBAIMOINIW]  &100], 0eM®3
anE@3, ©@sEEle  MOWIOHEleelR”  MIERHQAEM  TVAHHIAR @M%’]%@g@‘i
NM&DPN®O AGBRIMOANIMIV] aDEINUCIDH: @RYPLIIGo DWADWMAN MSalSld;hEs80S

colasalnm avowleslel

@ILIn006MI]s M@ MwamEsglad 90eqals MB®]1 ®Slygle: alelloo
afloo @¥1es]  all019.4|gHBMM®ICRIENIVT  VBEHIB  @RYAlal@ls] G@RYoMAY]
MIHW HOINOW BRYAYDEMo MLPNODDIMIT @SB ]IV alEIRWVWHQISHWIM.
58,176 &:Slyglds @0@;@8@@1@‘8 6,919 apemEmI@ 20@26eM” M AIBUNTD BRYoMAY]
aYlo @000 BonfaHM@ M@HIVIGBS®. DD AVOa02IOIEWILNEM” QB QlBatto
agomalem ®1dapesm@Im” 40% @:Slygle, @psw s’ 60% el swdomlgoe
®alem ayUMAV13 @RSWEEnMREndwd 50% afan®” 70% @RV 2VWATH a1
@YoMyl Mlo @eIdafllaj@’  EHo0fW” gelo BRONGHUNIW @@ITvawl emalgan
0D HOLIOM ERMEVWIRYNIW MIBE3URL] H®. QM AUGHHOD @RYoMAY] aylalm”
2021 @rway” 31 090 82aieum MT3HIM @AV OBGIFARM@IV]IGBIN Dalldo.
QM QIBUEBSICRID Galdorl DD aVIgo LIGHY (@Iafl ENMSIO® al0IRWAIGOIMSS

ALIWIDWIEM” HINOAND .



12

ad  adauesgloel  @yomayl  AVIHU  alEIRWES®IOM  HI06Mo
aleleuowlente® aflnge V103 @RAIMGIA{lE8IM®” ILNOB®AOY GMIoWALOm
malaimaosm’. MWl O8N0 @lalydallaflo AIYANEIG:UE &S1gEle: @RSWAIM
TUAMERLEIGIM OB 103 R &HS1IPIHY” H00eMRI® MG MdaNom]cd
QYO 1BHR0V alle0jdrud DmM2oWlgemMeaN” AlYGMA0eM.  @Rqflejd:So QlyNIn000sBGo
MEmMo DSBMM®  3¢1010661 8@ Je® i Slalom MICWIWa] @RAILIODIAINS
Jay® M@ Mldsnoonloel  aflleajnd  @IBOD] mo&nﬂrﬂgomﬂ MG
aJMABMIBM 999|500 20@CA @YoMAY] VIAHUE  LIGHU O3 o)) QD HQBS.
MHB®]1  B0H0  allpromleeigesam A1T®IIE  @yomayl  aVIQHud
®QV0ISHIOH@IMIES milefloel lyINO$:e80s” allewodla | coalq|SEmanD.

Odh. NI (@rgdmﬂ@o) (8]

@NGBOIGDYE EIWIH U (8a])

af)M. aHoy31m (8a])



alewoimmasolaf 11

2021-081 608 WME20)y mileflond @ramIdo Al @MVl 1975-061 eoH03
9H5lS Mo GO @000 001D HKHSISERUILS  BRMAI® VMAIMo M1EBH1G3
O:gls M@ 2JACHM@IM” AAITVN 21N, 200D  O®SISEBSOS  Galdlod
GROWIH®RV  MGOIDIBOYHUWB ENSMNM@™  @SQAINM  WMEHIY  mileflad
GOINOW  QAIYOITVNGHUY  DUINAIFOMEMo.  alBlIUOI®] AV Da0IBZalENIQ M1GM6M
@YIDNSO8 6(@J0Na0lo lESM@IMIV] 20CI® HHSISEBRBHS SQOMAlTN MM
25  ®20mm]  HOWEHHME®INN.  20FI®  OHSISERWRGS”  @MIEHBIM
MH®1VIBOI" GBaICIW aIQI®IBNEHIB WMHIQY MA@ QAlYGm2OW] AlyaITNuO
oeoom®IMiele  MG®]1  @gal’ 9WAeMIC®IMILje  mileflloel GG |06
QIyaITuNeWIS’ aflcila | GoaINSEBT.

af)@. af). OMENSSBD” (8a])

LM laU @203 GEROMVan (83a])



APPENDIX II

THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2021

As reported by the Subject Committee

[The words underlined/sidelined indicate the modefications suggested by the
Committee.]

A

BILL

to give effect to certain financial proposals of the Government of Kerala for the
Financial Year 2021-2022.

Preamble—WHEREAS, it is expedient to give effect to certain financial
proposals of the Government of Kerala for the Financial Year 2021-2022.

BE it enacted in the Seventy-second Year of Republic of India as follows;—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Finance Act, 2021.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act,-

(a) Sub-sections (3) and (4) of section 8 shall be deemed to have
come in to force on the 1% day of August, 2021.

(b) sub- section (5) of section 8 shall be deemed to have come into
force on the I day of June, 2021, remaining provisions of section 8§ shall come
into force on such date as the Government may, by notification in the official
Gazette, appoint:

Provided that different dates may be appointed for different provisions of
this section and any reference in any such provision to the commencement of this
Act shall be constructed as areference to the coming into force of that provision.

(c) the remaining sections of this Act, shall be deemed to have come
into force on the 10" day of June, 2021.

1205/202L




16

2. Amendment of Act 11 of 1957.—In the Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act,
1957 (11 of 1957), in section 3A,—

(1) in sub-section (1), —

(a) in clause (i), for the words “fifty per cent”, the words “seventy per

cent” shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (ii), for the words “forty per cent”, the words “sixty per

cent” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (4), for the words “an assessee”, the words “a year”
shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (5),—

(a) for the words and figures “30™ November, 2020, occurring at both
the places, the words and figures “30™ November, 2021” shall be substituted;

(b) for the words and figures “31* March, 2021, the words and figures
“31st March, 2022” shall be substituted;

(4) in sub-section (7), for the words and figures “ 31% March, 20217, the
words and figures “31% March, 2022” shall be substituted;

(5) after sub-section (12), the following sub-section shall be inserted,

namely:—

“(12A) Where any amount has been paid in part under this section during
the year 2020-21, the amount so paid shall be appropriated towards the earliest
arrear, and the balance amount, if any, shall be appropriated towards the arrears of
subsequent years. In the case where such amount is to be given credit towards the
arrears opted to be settled under this section, the amount shall be given credit as

surcharge before reckoning the arrears to be settled under sub-section (6).”

Explanation:—For the purpose of this section, “earliest arrear” means the
outstanding dues related to the oldest year among the arrears pending against an

assessee.”



17

3. Amendment of Act 10 of 1960.—In the Kerala Court Fees and Suits
Valuation Act, 1959 (10 of 1960), in section 76, to sub-section (1) the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“ Provided that in the case of appeals under the Kerala State Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (20 of 2017) the maximum limit of additional court fee
leviable shall not exceed rupees twenty thousand”.

4. Amendment of Act 15 of 1963.—In the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963
(15 of 1963),—

(1) in section 7, in the proviso, after the figures and symbol “2014-15”,
the word, figures and symbol “and 2015-16” shall be inserted;

(2) in sub-section (1) of section 7A,—

(i) in clause (i), after the figures and symbol “2014-15”, the word,
figures and symbol “and 2015-16” shall be inserted;

(ii) in clause (iii),—
(a) for the words and figures “ 31% March, 2020” occurring at both

the places, the words and figures “ 31 December, 2020” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-clause (a), for the words and figures “30™ November,
2020”, the words and figures “30™ September, 2021”, shall be substituted;

() in sub-clause (d), for the words and figures “ 31* March, 20217,
the words and figures “ 31* October, 20217, shall be substituted.

(3) in section 23B,—
(i) in sub-section (1),—
(a) in clause (i),—

(i) in sub-clause (a), for the words “fifty per cent”, the words
“seventy per cent”, shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (b), for the words “forty per cent”, the words
“sixty per cent” shall be substituted,;



18

(b) in clause (ii), for the words and figures “ 31 March, 20207, the
words and figures “ 31° March, 20217, shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (4) for the words “an assessee” the words
“a year” shall be substituted;

(iii) in sub-section (5),—

(a) for the words and figures “30™ November, 2020”, occurring at both
the places, the words and figures “30™ November. 20217, shall be substituted;

(b) for the words and figures “ 31% March, 2021”, the words and
figures “31° March, 2022” shall be substituted;

(iv) in sub-section (7), for the words and figures “ 31* March,
20217, the words and figures 31% March, 2022” shall be substituted;

(v) after sub-section (11), the following sub-section shall be
inserted, namely:—

“(11A) Where any amount has been paid in part under this section during the
year 2020-21, the amount so paid shall be appropriated towards the earliest arrear,
and the balance amount, if any, shall be appropriated towards the arrears of
subsequent years. In the case where such amount is to be given credit towards the
arrears opted to be settled under this section, the amount shall be given credit as tax
before reckoning the arrears to be settled under sub-section (6).

Explanation:—For the purpose of this section, “earliest arrear” means the
outstanding dues related to the oldest year among the arrears pending against the
assessee.”

5. Amendment of Act 7 of 1975.—In the Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 (7 of
1975), in section 5, after sub-section (1) the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(1A) in the case of green building as defined in clause (xviiia) of section
2 of the Kerala Panchayat Raj Act, 1994 (13 of 1994) and clause (18a) of section 2
of the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994 (20 of 1994) the building tax shall be levied
at the rate of fifty per cent of the rate of building tax as specified in Schedule 1”.



19

6. Amendment of Act 15 of 1991.—In the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act,
1991 (15 of 1991), in section 37C,—

(1) in sub-section (1), —

(a) in clause (i), for the words “fifty per cent”, the words “seventy per
cent”, shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (ii), for the words “forty per cent”, the words “sixty per
cent”, shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (4), for the words “an assessee” the words “a year” shall
be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (5), —

(a) for the words and figures “30™ November, 2020”, occurring at both
the places, the words and figures “30™ November, 2021, shall be substituted;

(b) for the words and figures “ 31° March, 2021”, the words and
figures “ 31* March, 2022” shall be substituted;

(4) in sub-section (7), for the words and figures “ 31° March, 2021”, the
words and figures 31 March, 2022” shall be substituted;

(5) after sub-section (12), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(12A) Where any amount has been paid in part under this section during the
year 2020-21, the amount so paid shall be appropriated towards the earliest arrear,
and the balance amount, if any, shall be appropriated towards the arrears of
subsequent years. In the case where such amount is to be given credit towards the
arrears opted to be settled under this section, the amount shall be given credit as tax

before reckoning the arrears to be settled under sub-section (6).

Explanation:—For the purpose of this section, “earliest arrear” means the
outstanding dues related to the oldest year among the arrears pending against

the assessee.”.



20

7. Amendment of Act 30 of 2004.—In the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003
(30 of 2004), in the SCHEDULES, in the third Schedule, after serial number 98A
and the entries against it in columns (2) and (3), the following serial numbers and
entries shall, respectively, be inserted, namely:—

“98B Liquified Natural gas 2711.11.00
98C Natural gas in gaseous state 2711.21.00 .

8. Amendment of Act 20 of 2017.—In the Kerala State Goods And Services
Tax Act, 2017 (20 of 2017),—

(1) in section 7, in sub-section (1), after clause (a), the following clause
shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the 1st
day of July, 2017, namely:—

“(aa) the activities or transactions, by a person, other than an
individual, to its members or constituents or vice-versa, for cash, deferred payment
or other valuable consideration.

Explanation:(—For the purposes of this clause, it is hereby clarified that,
notwithstanding anything contained in any other law for the time being in force or
any judgment, decree or order of any Court, tribunal or authority, the person and its
members or constituents shall be deemed to be two separate persons and the supply
of activities or transactions inter se shall be deemed to take place from one such
person to another;”.;

(2) in section 16, in sub-section (2), after clause (a), the following clause
shall be inserted, namely:—

“(aa) the details of the invoice or debit note referred to in clause (a)
has been furnished by the supplier in the statement of outward supplies and such
details have been communicated to the recipient of such invoice or debit note in the
manner specified under section 37;”.;

(3) in section 35, sub-section (5) shall be omitted;

(4) for section 44, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—



21

“44. Annual return.—Every registered person, other than an Input Service
Distributor, a person paying tax under section 51 or section 52, a casual taxable
person and a non-resident taxable person shall furnish an annual return which may
include a self- certified reconciliation statement, reconciling the value of supplies
declared in the return furnished for the financial year, with the audited annual
financial statement for every financial year electronically, within such time and in

such form and in such manner as may be prescribed :

Provided that the Commissioner may, on the recommendations of the
Council, by notification, exempt any class of registered persons from filing annual

return under this section:

Provided further that nothing contained in this section shall apply to any
department of the Central Government or a State Government or a local authority,
whose books of account are subject to audit by the Comptroller and Auditor -
General of India or an auditor appointed for auditing the accounts of local

authorities under any law for the time being in force;”.

(5) in section 50, in sub-section (1), for the proviso, the following proviso
shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from

the 1st day of July, 2017, namely:—

“Provided that the interest on tax payable in respect of supplies made during
a tax period and declared in the return for the said period furnished after the due
date in accordance with the provisions of section 39, except where such return is
furnished after commencement of any proceedings under section 73 or section 74
in respect of the said period, shall be payable on that portion of the tax which is

paid by debiting the electronic cash ledger.”.

(6) in section 74, in Explanation 1, in clause (ii), for the words and figures
“sections 122, 125, 129 and 130", the words and figures “sections 122 and 125”
shall be substituted;



22

(7) in section 75, in sub-section (12), the following Explanation shall be

inserted, namely:—

‘Explanation:—For the purposes of this sub-section, the expression
"self-assessed tax" shall include the tax payable in respect of details of
outward supplies furnished under section 37, but not included in the return

furnished under section 39.’.

(8) In section 83, for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be

substituted, namely:—

“(1) Where, after the initiation of any proceeding under Chapter XII,
Chapter XIV or Chapter XV, the Commissioner is of the opinion that for the
purpose of protecting the interest of the Government revenue it is necessary so to
do, he may, by order in writing, attach provisionally, any property, including bank
account, belonging to the taxable person or any person specified in sub-section

(1A) of section 122, in such manner as may be prescribed.”;

(9) in section 107, in sub-section (6), the following proviso shall be

inserted, namely:—

“Provided that no appeal shall be filed against an order under sub-section (3)
of section 129, unless a sum equal to twenty-five per cent of the penalty has been

paid by the appellant.”;
(10) in section 129,—

(i) in sub-section (1), for clauses (a) and (b), the following clauses

shall be substituted, namely:—

“(a) on payment of penalty equal to two hundred per cent of the tax
payable on such goods and, in case of exempted goods, on payment of an amount
equal to two per cent of the value of goods or twenty-five thousand rupees,
whichever is less, where the owner of the goods comes forward for payment of

such penalty;



23

(b) on payment of penalty equal to fifty per cent, of the value of the
goods or two hundred per cent of the tax payable on such goods, whichever is
higher, and in case of exempted goods, on payment of an amount equal to five per
cent of the value of goods or twenty-five thousand rupees, whichever is less, where
the owner of the goods does not come forward for payment of such penalty;”;

(ii) sub-section (2) shall be omitted,;

(iii) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(3) The proper officer detaining or seizing goods or conveyance shall
issue a notice within seven days of such detention or seizure, specifying the penalty
payable, and thereafter, pass an order within a period of seven days from the date
of service of such notice, for payment of penalty under clause (a) or clause (b) of
sub-section (1).”;

(iv) in sub-section (4), for the words “No tax, interest or penalty”,
the words “No penalty” shall be substituted,;

(v) for sub-section (6), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(6) Where the person transporting any goods or the owner of such goods
fails to pay the amount of penalty under sub-section (1) within fifteen days from
the date of receipt of the copy of the order passed under sub-section (3), the goods
or conveyance so detained or seized shall be liable to be sold or disposed of
otherwise, in such manner and within such time as may be prescribed, to recover
the penalty payable under sub-section (3):

Provided that the conveyance shall be released on payment by the transporter
of penalty under sub-section (3) or one lakh rupees, whichever is less:

Provided further that where the detained or seized goods are perishable or
hazardous in nature or are likely to depreciate in value with passage of time, the
said period of fifteen days may be reduced by the proper officer.”.

(11) in section 130,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “Notwithstanding anything
contained in this Act, if ”, the word “Where” shall be substituted;

1205/2021.



24

(b) in sub-section (2), in the second proviso, for the words, brackets
and figures “amount of penalty leviable under sub-section (1) of section 1297, the
words “penalty equal to hundred per cent of the tax payable on such goods” shall

be substituted;
(c) sub-section (3) shall be omitted.
(12) for section 151, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“151. Power to call for information.—The Commissioner or an officer
authorised by him may, by an order, direct any person to furnish information
relating to any matter dealt with in connection with this Act, within such time, in

such form, and in such manner, as may be specified therein.”.
(13) in section 152,—
(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) the words “of any individual return or part thereof” shall

be omitted;

(ii) after the words “any proceedings under this Act”, the words
“without giving an opportunity of being heard to the person concerned”

shall be inserted;
(b) sub-section (2) shall be omitted;

(14) in Schedule II, paragraph 7 shall be omitted and shall be deemed to
have been omitted with effect from the 1st day of July, 2017.

9. Amendment of Act 5 of 2019.—In the Kerala Finance Act, 2019 (5 of
2019), in section 12,—

(1) in sub-section (1),—

(a) in clause (i), for the words “fifty per cent”, the words “seventy per

cent” shall be substituted;



25

(b) in clause (ii), for the words “forty per cent”, the words “sixty per
cent” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (4) for the words “an assessee” the words “a year” shall
be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (5),—

(a) for the words and figures “30" November, 2020”, occurring at both
the places, the words and figures “30™ November, 2021”, shall be substituted;

(b) for the words and figures “ 31* March, 2021, the words and
figures “31*March, 2022” shall be substituted.

(4) in sub-section (7), for the words and figures “ 31* March, 20217, the
words and figures “ 31* March, 2022” shall be substituted.

(5) after sub-section (12), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(12A) Where any amount has been paid in part under this section during
the year 2020-21, the amount so paid shall be appropriated towards the earliest
arrear, and the balance amount, if any, shall be appropriated towards the arrears of
subsequent years. In the case where such amount is to be given credit towards the
arrears opted to be settled under this section, the amount shall be given credit as tax
before reckoning the arrears to be settled under sub-section (6).

Explanation:—For the purpose of this section, “earliest arrears” means the
outstanding dues related to the oldest year among the arrears pending against
the assessee.”

10. Amendment of Act 7 of 2020.—In the Kerala Finance Act, 2020 (7 of
2020), in section 10,—

(1) in sub-section (1),—

(a) in clause (i), for the words “fifty per cent”, the words “seventy per
cent” shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (ii), for the words “forty per cent”, the words “sixty per
cent” shall be substituted.



26

(2) in sub-section (4) for the words “an assessee” the words “a year” shall
be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (5),—

(a) for the words and figures “30" November, 2020, occurring at
both the places, the words and figures “30™ November, 2021”, shall be

substituted;

(b) for the words and figures “ 31* March, 20217, the words and
figures “ 31* March, 2022” shall be substituted,;

(4) in sub-section (7), for the words and figures “ 31 March, 20217, the
words and figures “ 31* March, 2022” shall be substituted;

(5) after sub-section (12), the following sub-section shall be inserted,

namely,—

“(12A) Where any amount have been partially paid under this section
during the year 2020-21, the amount so paid shall be appropriated towards the
earliest arrear, and the balance amount, if any, shall be appropriated towards the
arrears of subsequent years. In the case where such amount is to be given credit
towards the arrears opted to be settled under this section, the amount shall be given

credit as tax before reckoning the arrears to be settled under sub-section (6).

Explanation:—For the purpose of this section, “earliest arrears” means
the outstanding dues related to the oldest year among the arrears pending against

the assessee.”

“11. Validation—(1) Notwithstanding the lapse of the Kerala Finance Bill,
2021 (Bill No. 280 of the Fourteenth Kerala Legislative Assembly) (hereinafter
referred to as the said Bill) and the cesser of force of law of the declared
provisions of the said Bill, anything done or any action taken, including levy and
collection of tax or duty, during the period from the 1% day of April, 2021 to the
9t day of June, 2021, by virtue of the declared provisions contained in the
said Bill, under the Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 (11 of 1957) or under the



27

Kerala Court Fees and Suits Valuation Act, 1959 (10 of 1960) or under the Kerala
General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of 1963) or under the Kerala Building Tax Act,
1975 (7 of 1975) or under the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 (15 of
1991) or under the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 2004) or under the
Kerala Finance Act, 2019 (5 of 2019) or under the Kerala Finance Act, 2020 (7 of
2020) (hereinafter referred to as the 'respective Acts'), as they stand amended by
the said Bill, shall be deemed to be and to have always been, for all purposes,
validly and effectively done or taken under the provisions of the respective Acts,

as if the said amendments had been in force at all material times.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in the respective Acts during the
period from 1% day of April, 2021 to the 9" day of June, 2021 during which the
declared provisions contained in the said Bill was in force, anything done or any
action taken by virtue of said provisions of the said Bill, shall be deemed to have
been validly done or taken under the respective Acts and no action shall lie against
any dealer or authority on the ground of short levy or refund of excess tax or duty
and tax or duty collected, if any, by a dealer or an authority, as the case may be,

shall be paid over to the Government.

Secretariat of the Kerala Legislature, S. V. UNNIKRISHNAN NAIR,
Thiruvananthapuram, Secretary,
August 5, 2021.



